
Regular Meeting
Monday, June 19, 2017 6:00 PM
Central 301 District Office, 275 South St, P.O. Box 396, Burlington, IL 60109

1. Call Meeting to Order - President Kellenberger
A. Roll Call
B. Approval of Agenda
2. Pledge of Allegiance
3. Public Open Forum
A. Recognition of Visitors
B. Public Comments
4. Action Reports
A. Consent Agenda
1) Minutes
B. Treasurer's Report
1) Payment of Bills
C. Approve Refuse Bid
D. Approve IHSA Annual Renewal Agreement
E. Approve Biology Textbook Adoption
F. Approve Chemistry Textbook Adoption
G. Approve College Physics/AP Physics Textbook Adoption
H. Approve Introduction to Business Textbook Adoption
I. Approve Child Development: Early Stages through Age 12 Textbook 
Adoption

J. Approve Overnight Trip for the Boys Track Team to attend the IHSA State 
Competition

K. Approve Overnight Trip for the Girls Track Team to attend the IHSA 
State Competition

L. Approve the Cross Country Overnight Trips to Peoria and WIsconsin
M. Approve Resolution Adopting Prevailing Wage Rates
N. Approve Financial Depositories
O. Approve Student Activity Fund Treasurers for F.Y. 2018
P. Appointment of Audit Committee
Q. Approve Resolution Authorizing Payment of Custodial/Maintenance 
Salaries and Utilities in Operations and Maintenance Fund.

R. Approve Resolution Designating Interest in the Education, Operations 
and Maintenance, Transportation and Working Cash funds

S. Approval of Contracts with Public Vendors that Exceed $1000 Net Revenue
T. Negative Balance Report
5. Information Reports
A. Committee Reports
B. CTE Regional Partnership - Agricultural Science/Greenhouse/Veterinarian 
Technology

C. Construction Update
D. High School Schedule Committee Update
E. Athletic Conference Update - Kishwaukee River Conference
F. Enrollment Report
6. FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT
A. Gabriella Lauricella SmartProcure Illinois requested copies of purchase 
orders from March 8, 2017 to the present.  We complied with her request.

7. Executive Session
A. “The appointment, employment, resignation, compensation, discipline, 



performance, or
dismissal of specific employees of the public body or legal counsel for 
the
public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an
employee or against the legal counsel for the District to determine its
validity [5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1)].              

B. Open Session
C. Action Items from Closed Session
1) Approve the Personnel Report
2) Approve the Collective Bargaining Agreement between the Board of 
Education and the Central Education Association

8. Board Open Forum
9. Adjourn
10. Call Meeting to Order - President Kellenberger
A. Roll Call
B. Approval of Agenda
11. Pledge of Allegiance
12. Public Open Forum
A. Recognition of Visitors
B. Public Comments
13. Action Reports
A. Consent Agenda
1) Minutes
B. Treasurer's Report
1) Payment of Bills
14. Information Reports
A. Committee Reports
15. FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT
16. Executive Session
A. “The appointment, employment, resignation, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or
dismissal of specific employees of the public body or legal counsel for 
the
public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an
employee or against the legal counsel for the District to determine its
validity [5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1)].              

B. Open Session
C. Action Items from Closed Session
1) Approve the Personnel Report
17. Board Open Forum
18. Adjourn



  

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 

Board of Education Minutes 
 

Where: Central High School Library Meeting:                         Regular 

Date: April 17, 2017 Time:                              6:00 p.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 
Gorman, Jeff Y   Stirn, Todd  Y 

C. Johnson Y  Mongan, Esther N 

T. Johnson Y  Pflug, Daina Y  

J. Marlovits Y  Ahlsted, Carrie N 

M. Penar Y  Bushman, Kristine N  

Rabe, Laura Y                                Diversey, Steve N 

Kellenberger, Jeff Y  Haug, Matthew Y 

   Jurs, Rebecca Y 

    King, Jeff Y 

   Lewis, Kim Y 

   McCastland, Kerrie Y  

   Mirenda, Pamela N  

   Paszt, Alex Y 

   Polowy, Dan Y  

   Potsic, Mike Y 

   Salamone, Julie Y 

   Schreiber, Jill N 

   Schuth, Daniel Y  

   Testone, Chris Y 

   Tobin, Brian Y 

   Vaughn, Michelle N  

   Walter, Carie Y 

    

Roll Call Roll call was taken at 6:01 p.m.   

 

 Present:   Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Absent: None 

 

Agenda Motion by Gorman second by C. Johnson to approve the agenda as presented. 

  

 Voting yes:   Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Consent Agenda Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to approve the consent agenda as presented.  

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

 

 

 



  

 

Fuel Bid Motion by Gorman second by T. Johnson to award the fuel bid to Feece Oil   

 as presented. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

  

Furniture Bid Motion by Penar second by Marlovits to approve the classroom furniture as 

presented. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Re-Paving Bid Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to approve re-paving bid to Geneva Paving 

as presented. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Social Studies Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to approve the Social Studies  

Adoption  Textbook adoption as presented. 

  

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Abstain: T. Johnson 

 

Overnight Trip Motion by Gorman second by Penar to approve the JV and Varsity volleyball 

overnight trips to 

 Rolling Prairie, Indiana and Eastern Illinois University as presented  

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Overnight Trip Motion by Gorman second by T. Johnson to approve the wrestling team overnight 

trip to 

 Illinois Wesleyan University as presented  

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

 

 

 

 

 



  

 

Overnight Trip Motion by Gorman second by C. Johnson to approve the Varsity Football overnight 

trip to Elmhurst College as presented  

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Budget Preparation Motion by Marlovits second by Penar to appoint persons to prepare the tentative 

budget. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

BOE Calendar Motion by Gorman second by T. Johnson to approve the Board of Education meeting 

calendar as presented. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Executive Session  Motion by Gorman second by Marlovits to adjourn open session and enter into 

executive session at 7:51 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Open Session Motion by Marlovits second by Penar to adjourn executive session and return to open 

session at    8:54 p.m. 

   

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Personnel Report Motion by Gorman second by T. Johnson to approve the personnel report for May as 

presented.   

  

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Agreement Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to approve the resignation agreement as 

presented. 

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 



  

 

Adjourn Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to Adjourn at 9:19 p.m.  

 

 Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

BOE Meeting  

1. Roll Call 

2. Pledge of Allegiance  

3. Public Open Forum 

 3.1 Recognition of Visitors –President Kellenberger and Dr. Stirn welcomed guests CEA and 

BEST representatives.  The board recognized Mike Schmidt for winning the Kane 

County High School Educator of the Year award. 

 3.2 Public Comment – BEST President, Jill Dieckhoff, welcomed Christina and Tina 

Johnson to the board and thanked former members Schmitt and Perry for their service to 

the board. 

 

4.0 Action Items 

4.1 Consent Agenda – The district received an impact fee check for March.  Seven home 

permits were issued totaling$48,828.63 and $4,963.35 in transition fees.  No impact fees 

for April have been received to date.  Dr. Stirn will update the board when April impact 

fees are received.  Total expenditures are running 67.05% compared to 63.71% a year 

ago.  The district revenues are at 81.47% compared to 46.24% a year ago.  The difference 

is due to the $22 million referendum funds added to the budget.  The district received 

news that the State may make a partial categorical before the school year ends.  If that 

happens, the State will still owe the district 1.5 payments for approximately $1.75 

million.  Early tax money has started to come in.  Even with the school tax rate 

decreasing $0.22 cents some property owners are seeing increases in their property taxes 

up to 9.8% due to property values assessing higher. 

 

4.2 Fuel Bid – the district received bids for fuel from two companies, Feece Oil and 

Petrochoice.  Petrochoice withdrew their bid due to an error in the LUST (leaking 

underground storage tank) tax.  Feece Oil was the low bidder and we have worked with 

this company for several years. 

 

4.3 Classroom Furniture Bid – Assistant Principal Kerri McCastland has been working on 

this project.  Ms. McCastland sent bids out to five companies for teacher 

desk/workstations and students desks and chairs for both students and teachers. 

BOS/Hayworth bid on an alternate desk with a laminate white board top and a cantilever 

chair that matches the teacher chair.  School Specialty supplied the low bid for the 

teacher workstation and chair.   

 

4.4 Repaving Bid at Prairie View and Lily Lake – four companies submitted bids.  Geneva 

Paving submitted the lowest responsible bid for $225,070.00.  The alternate bid includes 

a total grind down, and replacement of the parking lots.  One of the alternates includes 

the entrance that Lily Lake shares with the highway department.  Director Polowy is 

working with the highway department to see if they are interested in sharing the cost to 

have that paved. 

 



  

 

4.5 Social Studies Textbook Adoption – the new textbooks include Civics, Psychology and 

Sociology.  A classroom set of each textbook will be purchased along with a six year 

online subscription. 

 

4.6 Volleyball Overnight Trip – the junior varsity and varsity volleyball team is requesting 

permission to take two trips for tournaments.  The first trip is to Rolling Prairie, Indiana 

(July 11, 12, 2017) and to Eastern Illinois University (July 28-30, 2017). 

 

4.7 Wrestling Overnight Trip – the wrestling team is asking permission to attend an 

overnight training camp at Illinois Wesleyan (July 9-12) 

 

4.8 Football Overnight Trip – The varsity football team is requesting permission to attend a 

football training camp at Elmhurst College (July 24-27) 

 

4.9 Persons to Prepare the Tentative Budget – Daina Pflug, Esther Mongan, and Ron Cope 

will work together to prepare the budget.  Dr. Stirn congratulated Mrs. Pflug for 

completing her business manager course.  Daina will assume the role of business 

manager officially July 1, 2017. 

 

4.10 Board of Education Meeting Dates for the 2017-2018 School Year –Dr. Stirn shared the 

list of dates with board members at the re-organization meeting earlier this month.  

Approval of the dates is required. 

 

5.0 Information Reports –  

 5.1 DLT – the DLT met and discussed district priorities, accomplishments and goals for next 

year.  There is a lot of excitement with the growth of the blended pre school program.  

The administrative team at the elementary level is focused on making sure the all day 

kindergarten program is meaningful.  Our kindergarten program focuses on literacy and 

numeracy.  Elementary administrators are watching to make sure the gains are continuing 

through the grade levels and if they are not why?  They also look at behavior skills – 

some students have a helpless feeling and don’t persist how do we help students with 

this?  At the middle school compressed math is working well.  The 8th grade Algebra 

students are doing very well and maintaining the progression at high school.  At the high 

school administrators are working on increasing access to AP classes.  Research shows 

students who take at least one AP test students experience success toward college 

graduation.  The CTE program is growing administrators are looking at incubator and 

mobile app maker and looking to grow our AG program.  We are revamping and 

rebranding the district and the website, feedback was positive from the DLT team and 

twitter will launch in the fall.  Administration asked the DLT to assist with focus groups 

in the fall to gain feedback from the community how we best prepare for continuing 

enrollment growth and how do we maintain lowering the tax rate.  

  Foundation – the Burlington Days parade was discussed, they are looking at the pull 

string bags and credit card holders for mobile phones with the logo on it for a give-away.  

Trivia is still in the planning stages and the grant process is still in process.  The 

Foundation would like to see grants that tie in to the global picture.  The new grant 

process can be submitted by administrators, teachers, students and possibly in the future 

community members.  Announcements about the grants will go out at the end of the 

school year to be open September.  The foundation donated seed money for the 

referendum and would like to be featured in an alumni hall.  Dr. Stirn would like to see a 



  

 

themed flow for the all the parent groups so it doesn’t look chopped up.  He wants the 

hall to have a WOW factor.  In October of 2018 the foundation wants to bring back the 

Harlem Wizards and kick off the grand opening of the field house.  The high school 

library project is also supported by the foundation. 

 

 5.2 Mobile App Development and Business Incubator – Kelly Greene presented information 

on new CTE courses.  CTE is going through a state and nationwide revitalization.  The 

new requirements ensure it is an accredited program.  Students have the opportunity 

develop a product or service and work throughout the school year on all aspects of a 

business model.  At the end of the school year students pitch their product or service and 

may receive funding for their business.  For the students who don’t receive funding they 

can be hired by the students who receive funding.  Dr. Stirn shared what the students in 

Barrington have done.   

  The mobile app maker takes students through the basics of programming all the way 

through creating an app.  The two courses work well together and allow the community 

to be involved.  Both courses have been approved by the CCC and will be introduced in 

the fall of the 2018-2019 school year.  These courses will strengthen our business 

program.  The idea is to partner with area districts to allow for more CTE offerings.  

There is grant money available to increase CTE offerings, possibilities include a 

greenhouse for agriculture and kennels for vet tech.  St.Charles has students interested in 

equine courses and U-46 has a welding program that allows students to be hired as 

apprentices right out of high school.  Partnering with these districts will allow for greater 

CTE opportunities. 

 

 5.3 Construction Update – Director Polowy took Board Members through the phase I 

addition.  Ceilings are in and painting has begun.  In July they will start getting ready for 

students.  Phase II starts next week.  Library update in in process.  The kitchen bid will 

go out at the end of summer.  

 

 5.4 Course Approval Process – Principal Testone shared how courses are approved.  The 

process is very long and they are looking for a way to streamline the process.  The high 

school has developed a parent advisory committee that assists with process of approving 

courses.  The process is not really shortened but streamlined.  The CCC is considering 

changing its bylaws to take a consensus vote rather than a fist of five they currently use.   

 

 5.5 Central High School Graduation – Friday, June 2, 2017 – Graduation will be held at the 

NIU Convocation Center.  Ceremony begins at 7:00, Board members should arrive by 

6:15 p.m.  Students are creating a video to show parents and families the process they 

will go through from NIU. 

 

 5.6 Board Committee Assignments –  

  DLT – Jeff Kellenberger, Tina Johnson 

  CCC – Christine Johnson, Mitch Penar 

  EPC – Jan Marlovits, Christine Johnson 

  Policy – Jan Marlovits, Laura Rabe 

  Finance – Jan Marlovits 

  Foundation – Laura Rabe, Mitch Penar 

 

 



  

 

 5.7 Chemistry Textbook Adoption – Textbooks were reviewed with the Science Department 

– a classroom set will be purchased along with a six year online license.  The new books 

are necessary to align with the Next Generation Science Standards. 

 

 5.8 Biology Textbook Adoption – These textbooks were also reviewed with the Science 

Department – a classroom set will be purchased along with a six year online license. The 

new Biology books are necessary to align with the Next Generation Science Standards. 

 

 5.9 College Physics/AP Physics Textbook Adoption – The current textbooks are eleven years 

old and need to be updated to the NGSS standards.  These textbooks were also reviewed 

with the Science Department – a classroom set will be purchased along with a six year 

online license. 

 

 5.10 Introduction to Business Textbook Adoption - These textbooks were also reviewed with 

the department chairs – a classroom set will be purchased along with a six year online 

license.  The current textbooks are out of date. 

 

 5.11 Child Development:  Early Stages through Age 12 textbook adoption – Currently there 

are not enough textbooks for each student and the books are from two different years.  

These textbooks were also reviewed with the Department Chair – a classroom set will be 

purchased along with an online subscription license. 

 

5.12 Enrollment Report – Enrollment was taken May 11 and 9 new students have enrolled.  

Lily Lake enrolled 6 students, Prairie View 1 and the high school is down 1   

 

. 6.0 FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 

 

 6.1 Daniel Stocker - Midwest Bus Sales – Requested the bid tabulations from the last bid opening. 

 

6.2 Illinois Retired Teachers Association – Requested and district emails for retiring teachers and 

email addressed of all employees 

 

Executive Session 

 6.1 Adjourn Open Meeting 

6.2 Return to Open Session 

 6.3 Action Items from Closed Session 

 

7.0 ADJOURN 

 

 

 

 

 

Jeff Kellenberger, President                                                 Christina Johnson, Secretary 

 

 

 

Next Meeting:  June19, 2017 









































































































                BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 
 

FROM: DR. TODD STIRN, SUPERINTENDENT OF SCHOOLS   

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION FOR ACCEPTANCE OF REFUSE BID 

DATE: 06/19/2017 

 

Bid specifications were sent to four companies for the 2017-2086 and the 2018-2019 

school year.  We received bids from three companies.  Republic Services was the lowest 

responsible bidder. The bid from Republic Servcives is recommended for your approval.  

Please see the accompanying bid comparison summary. 



May 30,2017 Refuse Bid

Vendor Year Refuse Recycle TOTAL

Waste Management Year 1 $15,205.00 $4,010.00 $19,215.00
Year 2 $15,737.18 $4,150.35 $19,887.53

Republic Year 1 $15,821.81 $3,179.95 $19,001.76
Year 2 $15,821.81 $3,179.95 $19,001.76

Groot Year 1 $29,628.00 $5,676.00 $35,304.00
Year 2 $29,628.00 $5,676.00 $35,304.00

Veolia Year 1 No Bid No Bid
Year 2 No Bid No Bid

Vendor 20 yard roll off30 yard roll off appliance portolets

Waste 280.00/haul 320.00/haul 60/unit
1 / wk -
75./mo

waste
2/wk -

110./mo







               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: SCIENCE TEXTBOOKS – BIOLOGY AND CHEMISTRY  

DATE: 6/15/2017 

 

 

Textbook for Miller Levine Biology 2017 -  total cost $33,793.90 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 120 textbooks with digital license 

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Student Textbook (grade 9/10)  – ISBN 

9781323205846 – 120 hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - 

$101.47@ 120  = $12,176.40   

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  – 250 licenses @ 

$86.47 = 21,617.50 

Miller Levine Biology 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (4) 

 

The 120 hardcover textbooks allow 30 copies for 4 classrooms, in addition to the digital 

students texts.  

 

Textbook for Pearson Chemistry 2017 -  total cost $8,412.30 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 6 textbooks with digital license 

 Pearson Chemistry Student Textbook (grade 10/11) – ISBN 9781323205891 – 30 

hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - $101.47 = $3,044.10   

 Pearson Chemistry 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  (REALIZE)  – 60    

6-year license $89.47 = 5,368.20 

Chemistry 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (1) 

 

Shipping and Handling - $1,222.12 

Total cost - $43,428.32 

 

Rationale: Textbooks for both biology and chemistry need to be updated to match the 

Next Generation Science Standards. Department Chair Hovious and team have reviewed 

and selected these texts for your courses. The textbooks are aligned nicely with the NGSS 

standards and the online tools provide for excellent resources for both students and 

teachers.  



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: SCIENCE TEXTBOOKS – BIOLOGY AND CHEMISTRY  

DATE: 6/15/2017 

 

 

Textbook for Miller Levine Biology 2017 -  total cost $33,793.90 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 120 textbooks with digital license 

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Student Textbook (grade 9/10)  – ISBN 

9781323205846 – 120 hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - 

$101.47@ 120  = $12,176.40   

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  – 250 licenses @ 

$86.47 = 21,617.50 

Miller Levine Biology 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (4) 

 

The 120 hardcover textbooks allow 30 copies for 4 classrooms, in addition to the digital 

students texts.  

 

Textbook for Pearson Chemistry 2017 -  total cost $8,412.30 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 6 textbooks with digital license 

 Pearson Chemistry Student Textbook (grade 10/11) – ISBN 9781323205891 – 30 

hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - $101.47 = $3,044.10   

 Pearson Chemistry 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  (REALIZE)  – 60    

6-year license $89.47 = 5,368.20 

Chemistry 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (1) 

 

Shipping and Handling - $1,222.12 

Total cost - $43,428.32 

 

Rationale: Textbooks for both biology and chemistry need to be updated to match the 

Next Generation Science Standards. Department Chair Hovious and team have reviewed 

and selected these texts for your courses. The textbooks are aligned nicely with the NGSS 

standards and the online tools provide for excellent resources for both students and 

teachers.  



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: COLLEGE PHYSICS/AP PHYSICS 

DATE: 6/15/2017 

 

Textbook for College Physics/AP Physics  -  total cost $8,230.75 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 60 Digital Bundles 

 College Physics, 11 e-Student Edition + WebAssign (6 year access) – 30 - 6-year 

license, 30 physical textbooks @ $180.00 per unit = $5,400 

 

 College Physics, 11e Web Assign (6 year access) – Serway 11th Edition [STM, 

2018] – 10 digital seats for 6-years. @ $140.00 per unit = $1,400.00 

 

 K12HS Fast Track to 5 College Physics – 35  @ $19.50 per unit $682.50 

 

 Teacher Resource Guide - Free 

 

Estimated Shipping and Handling - $8,230.75 

 

 

Rationale: Update textbooks to meet the new NGSS standards and College Board. 

Current AP Physics textbooks are out dated and have not been replaced for 11 years. The 

current book is a 2006 version.  



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: FUNDAMENTALS OF BUSINESS 

DATE: 6/15/2017 

 

 

Introduction to Business -  Total Cost $7,921.89 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 31 textbooks  

 

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business – 31 textbooks  @ $83.31 = $2,582.61   

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business online 6-year Subscription  - 60 licenses @ 

$83.31 = $4998.60 

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business Teacher 6-year - free 

 

Shipping and Handling - $173.27 

Total cost - $7,921.10 

 

 

Rationale: The textbooks are out-of-date and the department chair and teachers have 

selected this textbook because it allows connection to all the transition courses within this 

strand within the business cluster.  

 

 



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: CHILD DEVELOPMENT 

DATE: 6/15/2017 

 

Textbook for Child Development  -  total cost $12,700.77 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 31 Digital Bundles 

 Child Development:  Early Stages through Age 12 - 8th Edition – 31 units @ 

$110.94 = $3,439.14 

ONLINE STUDENT CENTER – 111 units @ $82.80 = $9,190.80 

 

ONLINE TEACHER RESOURCE – 2 units - Free 

 

Estimated Shipping and Handling - $70.83 

Total cost - $12,700.77 

 

Rationale: Currently we do not have enough textbooks to provide one for each student 

taking the course. Additionally, the textbooks for the class are from two different years. 

In lieu of purchasing old textbooks, the department chair is requesting an updated 

textbook for the course.  

 













































 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

To:    Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From:   Daina Pflug, Treasurer  

 

Subject:  Approval of Financial Depositories 

 

Date:   June 13, 2017 

 

 

Our policies require that the Board annually approve the list of depositories for 

school funds for the new fiscal year. 

 

The primary depositories are:  

 

1. Old Second Bank 

2. Illinois Funds (State Treasurer’s Investment Pool)  

3. PMA Securities, Inc (Referendum Bonds-ISDLAF)   

 

 
 

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 
Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent 

275 South St., P.O. Box 396  Burlington, IL 60109 
847-464-6005 847-464-6021 Fax  www.burlington.k12.il.us 

  

http://www.burlington.k12.il.us/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

To:  Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From: Daina Pflug, Treasurer 

 

Subject: Approval of Student Activity Funds’ Treasurers 

 

Date:  June 13, 2017 

 

 

The Board is required by policy to annually appoint activity fund treasurers each 

school year. For the 2017-2018 school year those persons recommended are: 

 

Pam Israelson   Elementary and Middle Schools 

 

Jan Maas    Central High School 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 
Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent 

275 South St., P.O. Box 396  Burlington, IL 60109 
847-464-6005 847-464-6021 Fax  www.burlington.k12.il.us 

  

http://www.burlington.k12.il.us/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

To:  Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From:  Daina Pflug, Treasurer  

 

Subject: Appointment of Audit Committee 

 

Date:  June 13, 2017 

 

 

 

Each year the Board must appoint a finance committee chair and one other member 

to serve on the audit committee. The purpose of this committee is to represent the 

Board in case the auditor wishes to confer with the Board. Often it just involves a 

phone call with the chair but there could be occasions that the auditor wishes to 

meet face to face with the committee. It might be logical to have those persons 

presently on the finance committee to also serve on this committee. The committee 

chair is Janet Marlovits and another member must be selected. 
 
 

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 
Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent 

275 South St., P.O. Box 396  Burlington, IL 60109 
847-464-6005 847-464-6021 Fax  www.burlington.k12.il.us 

  

http://www.burlington.k12.il.us/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

To: Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From: Daina Pflug, Treasurer  

 

Date:      June 13, 2017 

 

Subject: Resolution Authorizing Payment of Custodial & Maintenance Salaries 

& Utilities from the Operations & Maintenance Fund 

 

 

A resolution is required from the Board to authorize the payment of salaries for 

custodians & maintenance personnel and utilities from the Operations & 

Maintenance Fund rather than the Education Fund. This is an annual resolution that 

the Board approves each year.  

 

See attached resolution.  
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RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF EDUCATION OF 
 CENTRAL COMMUNITY UNIT SCHOOL DISTRICT #301 

KANE & DEKALB COUNTIES, ILLINOIS 
 
 

AUTHORIZATION OF PAYMENT OF CUSTODIAL & 
MAINTENANCE SALARIES & UTILITIES IN THE 

OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE FUND IN FISCAL YEAR 2018 
 

 

Be it resolved that the Board of Education approves the payment of 
its salaries for custodians & maintenance personnel and payment 
of utility bills in the Operations & Maintenance Fund for fiscal year 
2018. 
 
Adopted this 19th day of June, 2017 by Central Community Unit 
School District #301 Board of Education by the following roll call 
vote: 
 
 
AYE: 
 
 
NAY: 
 
 
_________________________________    President           Date _____________________ 
 
 
 

____________________________________Secretary              Date ____________________ 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

To:  Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From:  Daina Pflug, Treasurer 

 

Subject: Resolution Designating Interest Income in the Education,  

Operations & Maintenance, Transportation, & Working Cash      

  Funds 

 

Date:  June 13, 2017 

 

 

The Board is required to approve a resolution designating interest in the four main 

operating funds in order to prevent interest monies in these funds from becoming 

principal.  

 

Attached is the resolution.         
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RESOLUTION 

 

 OF THE BOARD OF EDUCATION OF 

 CENTRAL COMMUNITY UNIT SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 301 

 KANE AND DEKALB COUNTIES, ILLINOIS 

 

DESIGNATING INTEREST IN THE EDUCATION, OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE,  

TRANSPORTATION & WORKING CASH  FUNDS 

  

 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to Illinois State Board of Education Regulation Section 

100.50(a)(4), effective Fiscal Year 2009, unless otherwise provided by statute or specified by 

board resolution adopted prior to June 30 of a fiscal year, interest earnings shall be added to and 

become part of principal as of June 30 of the fiscal year; and  

 

[WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 20-5 of the School Code (105 ILCS 5/20-5), moneys 

earned as interest from the investment of the Working Cash Fund, or any portion thereof, may be 

transferred from the Working Cash Fund to another fund of the district without any requirement 

of repayment of the Working Cash Fund, upon the authority of the school board by separate 

resolution directing the school treasurer to make such transfer and stating the purpose therefore as 

authorized; and] 

 

[WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 10-22.44 of the School Code (105 ILCS 5/10-22.44), 

interest earned from any moneys of the District (except moneys on funds for purposes of Illinois 

Municipal Retirement; Tort Immunity, Fire Prevention, Safety, Energy Conservation and School 

Security; and Capital Improvement tax proceeds under Section 17-2.3, all as itemized in Section 

10-22.44) may be transferred to the respective fund of the District that is most in need of such 

interest income, as determined by the Board, unless such interest has otherwise been earmarked or 

restricted by the Board for a designated purpose; and] 

  

WHEREAS, the Board of Education ("Board") of the Central Community Unit School 

District No. 301, Kane and DeKalb Counties, Illinois (“District”) has determined it to be in the 

best interests of the District to maintain accrued interest in the Education, Operations & 

Maintenance, Transportation, & Working Cash Funds as distinct from principal so that such 

interest is available for statutory transfer to another fund in accordance with the School Code as 

described above and other authorizing law during the 2016-2017 fiscal year; and 

 

WHEREAS, no interest accrued in the Education, Operations & Maintenance, 

Transportation & Working Cash Funds represents interest earned on federal or State grant funds. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, It is hereby resolved by the Board of Education of Central 

Community Unit School District No. 301 as follows: 

 

Section 1.  The Board hereby designates that the interest accrued in the Education, 

Operations & Maintenance, Transportation & Working Cash Funds as of June 30, 2017, be 

maintained as interest, and not be added to or become a part of principal, in the Education, 



Operation & Maintenance, Transportation, & Working Cash Funds for the duration of the 2016-

2017 fiscal year, unless such interest is transferred to another Fund pursuant to separate resolution 

of the Board or expended. 

 

Section 2.  The Board finds, subject to adjustment by the District auditors, that the interest 

accrued in the Education Fund as of May 31, 2017 is $26,454.03, in the Operations & Maintenance 

Fund as of May 31, 2017 is $13,464.24, in the Transportation Fund as of May 31, 2017 is 

$1,892.73, & in the Working Cash Fund as of May 31, 2017 is $4,305.98.  The Treasurer is 

authorized and directed to maintain the designation of this interest money, together with any 

additional interest accrued in the Education, Operations & Maintenance, Transportation, & 

Working Cash Funds as of June 30, 2017, as interest on the books of the School District in 

accordance with Section 1 of this Resolution. 

 

Section 3.  This Resolution shall be in full force and effect immediately upon its adoption. 

 

ADOPTED this 19th day of June 2017, by the following roll call vote: 

 

AYE: 

 

NAY: 

 

ABSENT: 

 

 

       

President, Board of Education 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

       

Secretary, Board of Education 
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To:  Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 

 

From:  Daina Pflug, Treasurer  

 

Subject: Approval of Contracts with Public Vendors that Exceed $1000 Net 

Revenue 

   

Date:  June 13, 2017 

 

 

The Board is required to approve contracts with public vendors that are anticipated 

to exceed $1000 in net revenue in the upcoming school year.  In the fall when we 

submit our budget to the State we then have to show actual net revenue received 

from the previous school year. Often these vendors consist of school pictures, 

candy, soft drinks, student artwork or fundraising cards companies.   
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PUBLIC VENDOR CONTRACTS FOR 2017-18 SCHOOL YEAR ANTICIPATED TO EXCEED $1000 IN NET REVENUE

Name of Vendor Product or Service Provided Purpose of Proceeds

Inter-State Studio Student Pictures-CHS Educational Supplies/Yearbook

Adrenaline Fundraising Fundraising Cards/Gourmet Treats-CHS Educational Supplies/Athletics/Activities

Country Lights Soy Candles Fundraising Products-Candles-CHS Educational FFA Supplies

Great American Opportunities Fundraising Products-Candy-CHS Educational/Athletics/Activities Supplies

Butter Braids Fundraising Products-Candy-CHS Educational/Athletics/Activities Supplies

Rite-Bite Fundraising Fundraising Butter Braids-CT Educational Supplies

Inter-State Studio Student Pictures-CT Educational Supplies

Inter-State Studio Student Pictures-PV Educational Supplies

Art to Remember Student Artwork sales-PV Educational Supplies

Inter-State Studio Student Pictures-PKMS Educational Supplies/Yearbook

Inter-State Studio Student Pictures-HBT Educational Supplies

CMS-none
LL-none



 

 
 
 
 
TO:           Dr. Todd E. Stirn 
                 Superintendent of Schools 
                 Central Community USD 301 Schools 
 
FROM:     Pamela J Mirenda 
                  Director of Food Services 
                  Central Community USD 301 Schools 
 
RE:            POLICY FOR UNPAID MEAL CHARGES 
 
Date:        June 19, 2017 
 
 
The USDA requires all School Districts in the National School Lunch Program (NSLP) to have a written 
and clearly communicated policy to address unpaid meal charges by July 1, 2017. 
 
Attached is the CENTRAL COMMUNITY USD 301 MEAL CHARGE / NEGATIVE BALANCE POLICY. 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

Effective July 1, 2017 

CENTRAL COMMUNITY USD 301 MEAL CHARGE/NEGATIVE BALANCE POLICY 

Students in all school levels:  elementary, middle and high school are offered a USDA Value Meal.  

Students can choose the Value Meal of the Day, purchase only Milk to accompany a cold lunch from 

home or purchase ala carte items to have with their lunch (ala carte items sold in Middle & Senior High 

schools only). 

This policy explains the procedures to follow when children eligible to receive reduced price lunches or 

paid lunches do not have money in their account or in hand to cover the cost of their lunch at the time 

of service.   

Students eligible for free lunches will be the served the Value Meal of the Day.  Students eligible for 

free lunch will receive a lunch (including a milk).  If a student is eligible for free lunches and brings a 

cold lunch from home and wants to have a milk with his/her cold lunch, the milk must be purchased.  

They are not eligible to receive only a milk. 

 

 ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS 

LUNCH:  Elementary students without money, for lunches, are allowed to charge $10.00. Until the 

charge is paid, the students will be provided an alternate lunch of a cold cheese sandwich, fruit and a 

milk at a charge of $1.50.  Once the balance reaches $20.00, the District will no longer provide lunches 

for your student and you will need to make other arrangements until the balance is paid in full. 

MILK:  Students may charge up to 5 milks or $2.00 before they can no longer charge a milk. 

 

MIDDLE SCHOOLS 

LUNCH:  Middle School students may charge 2 Value Meals.  Until the charged amount is paid, the 

students will be provided an alternate lunch of cold cheese sandwich, fruit and a milk at a charge of 

$1.50.  No other charges will be allowed.  Once the balance reaches $15.00, the District will no longer 

provide lunches for your student and you will need to make other arrangements until the balance is 

paid in full. 

 

HIGH SCHOOL 

LUNCH:  Charging for the Value Meal of the Day or any Ala Carte items is not permitted.  Students must 

have money in their lunch account or in hand. 
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LUNCH ACCOUNTS  

Parents/Guardians can access their childrens’ lunch accounts in MySchoolBucks.com via their Student 

ID Number.  Parents/Guardians can deposit money into their students’ account by: 

 Opening a MySchoolBucks.com account.  Money can be deposited into an account by using a 
credit card or allowing a withdrawal from a checking account.  Every time you make a deposit 
into MySchoolBucks.com there will be a charge of $1.95.  When a prepayment of $40 or more is 
received the student receives a bonus lunch. 
a. For families with more than 1 student, each student in the family has a separate lunch 

account accessed through their Student ID Number.  Money must be entered separately into 
each account.  OR 

b. A personal check can be deposited into the student’s account.  Middle & High Schools can 
deposit the check at the POS Register.  At the Elementary schools, students will give the 
check to their classroom teacher and the check will be forwarded to the Lunch Room, for 
account credit and deposit.  OR 

c. Cash can be deposited into the student’s account at the POS Register in the Middle & High 
Schools, only. 

 
If families wish to move money from 1 child’s account to another child’s account, they must call the 
Food Service Office at 847-464-6043 to make the request or send an email to foodservice 
@central301.net 
 
NOTIFICATION OF CHARGED MEALS 
 
Each school’s Negative Balance report is checked daily. For the students’ account in a negative 
balance, a Negative Balance Letter (notification of Charged Meals/Negative Balance $$ amounts) is 
sent to Parents/Guardians daily via email, to the email address provided when the student was 
registered.  Also, Negative Balance Letters are sent home with Elementary students in their backpacks.   
 
DELINQUENT DEBT 
 
When the payment is overdue, the debt is classified as delinquent as long as the student is still 
enrolled in a Central 301 School.  Efforts to collect amounts owed will continue by emailing a Negative 
Balance Letters to parents/guardians daily via email.  Unpaid charges at the end of the school year will 
be carried over to the new school year.  The delinquent debt will remain on the Food Service records 
for up to 60 school days.  After 60 school days, this debt becomes an uncollectable bad debt. The debt 
will then be turned over to a collections agency for payment.    
 
Parents/guardians will be reminded of unpaid Food Service charges when students are withdrawn from 
the Central 301 Schools or when the students are registered for the new school year. 
 
 
6/13/2017 





 

    BOARD OF EDUCATION 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 
 DR. TODD STIRN, SUPERINTENDENT 

FROM: STEVE DIVERSEY, DIRECTOR OF ATHLETIC & ACTIVITIES  
  
SUBJECT: ATHLETIC CONFERENCE UPDATE 

DATE: 6/12/2017 

 
This memo is an update on the status of Central High School and our membership in the 
Kishwaukee River Conference.  The first vote to dismiss us from the KRC was taken on 
May 3, 2017, the result was five (5) yes and one (1) no.  The Kishwaukee Board of 
Controls voted to meet again on May 15, 2017 for the second vote.  The vote on May 
15, 2017, was four (4) yes and one (1) no.  What this means for Central, according to the 
Kishwaukee River Constitution is that we have two years to find a new athletic 
conference. 
 
Since the dismissal of Central from the Kishwaukee River Conference, Principal Testone 
and Athletic Director Diversey met to establish a communication timeline.  The timeline 
is as follows: 
 

1. First Vote- 5/3 

2. Second Vote-5/15 

3. Meeting with Todd-5/16 

4. Meeting with Coaches - 5/18 

5. Meeting with the Booster Executive Board - 6/1 

6. Meeting with Todd & Chris about options - 6/12 

7. Meeting with the Booster Club - 6/12 

8. Update the School Board - 6/19 

9. Discussion Forum with Coaches - TBD Fall 2017 

10. Discussion Forum with Community - TBD Fall 2017 

 
What are the potential options for Central High School?  There is one (1) odd number 
conference in our area that has been looking for one (1) team and another conference 
looking to split into East and West Divisions.  The two (2) conferences are The Fox Valley 
and The Northern Illinois Big Twelve.  We have received an interest letter from The Fox 
Valley Conference and Central is anticipating the same from The Northern Illinois Big 
Twelve once their conference finds out the fate of Morris, who has expressed a desire to 
leave.  Also, depending on the status of The Northern Illinois Big Twelve there could be 



2 

another opportunity.  
 
 
 
 
The schools that make up The Fox Valley: 

1. Cary Grove 
2. Crystal Lake Central 
3. Crystal Lake South 
4. Prairie Ridge 
5. Dundee Crown 
6. Hampshire 
7. Huntley 
8. Jacobs 
9. McHenry 

 
The schools that make up The Northern Illinois Big Twelve: 

1. DeKalb 
2. Geneseo 
3. LaSalle Peru 
4. Kaneland 
5. Morris-Looking to Leave 
6. Ottawa 
7. Rochelle 
8. Sterling 
9. Sycamore 
10. Yorkville 

 
Third Opportunity if there is split: 

1. Belvidere 
2. Belvidere North 
3. DeKalb 
4. Kaneland 
5. Sycamore 

 
The Central High School Administration with Superintendent Stirn will continue to 
explore all options as they arise and continue to update the Board of Education on our 
progress.  The Administration is not thinking we will be seeking any Board of Education 
approval until the fall of 2018.  



Central Community Unit School District 301
Student Enrollment Report Date  June 5, 2017

School Count EE KDG 1st 2nd 3rd 4th 5th 6th 7th 8th 9th 10th 11th 12th Current Last Month Change
Total Total

Country Trails 2016 113 100 120 111 95 96 635 636 -1
2015 93 113 107 90 90 83 576

H.B. Thomas 2016 100 98 85 93 72 82 80 610 609 +1
2015 81 82 81 71 84 73 90 562

Lily Lake 2016 23 47 32 34 36 30 202 204 -2
2015 39 31 32 32 32 52 218

Prairie View 2016 120 109 107 103 112 83 634 634
2015 98 100 107 110 77 76 568

Prairie Knolls MS 2016 322 334 656 660 -4
2015 321 287 601

Central MS 2016 279 279 279
2015 268 267

Central HS 2016 289 256 257 240 1042 1042
2015 256 253 255 239 1003

TOTAL DISTRICT Head 100 354 341 352 320 325 289 322 334 279 289 256 257 240 4058 4064 -6
81 312 325 317 316 272 301 321 287 268 256 253 255 239 3795

Special Education 
Out-of-District 1 5 2 4 1 8 2 6 2 1 3 2 3 10 50

 
Contract Class Size Language Aide/Split 6th Day Enrollment Year to Date +/-
Kindergarten - 2 23/26 *6th day 2015/2016 - 3783
Grade 3 - 5 25/28 4005 53
Grade 6-8 30 split

Grades 9th -12th 31 split
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