
Regular Meeting
Tuesday, January 19, 2016 6:00 PM
Central 301 District Office, 275 South St, P.O. Box 396, Burlington, IL 60109

1. Meeting Call to Order
A. Roll Call
B. Approve Agenda
2. Pledge of Allegience
3. Public Open Forum
A. Recognition of Visitors
B. Public Comment
C. Correspondence and Recognition 
4. Action Reports
A. Consent Agenda
1) Minutes
B. Treasurer's Reports
C. Approve and Award the Bus Lease for the 2016-2017 School Year
D. Approve the Advanced Placement Computer Science Course Change
E. Six Month Review Executive Session Minutes
5. Information Reports
A. Early Childhood Blended Learning
B. Foreign Language Program Student Trips
C. Committee Reports
D. Summer School Course Fees Middle School & High School
E. Community Focus Group Feedback - Expansion Options for CHS
F. Five Essentials Survey Results
G. School Lunch Prices for School Year 2016-2017
H. Enrollment Report
6. Freedom of Information Act (FOIA)
A. Larry Gnatt from Local Roofers 11 requested the certified payroll for 
DCG roofers

B. Larry Gnatt from Local Roofers 11 revised his original request to 
receive all invoices paid to DCG Roofers

C. Lindsey Otte from Athletico Physical Therapy requested the districts' 
contract for athletic training services

D. Daily Herald - Annual FOIA notifying them of Board Meetings
7. Executive Session
A. Adjourn to Closed Session to hear information regarding:
"The appointment, employment, resignation, discipline, performance, or 
dismissal of specific employees of the public body or legal counsel for 
the public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against 
an employee or against the legal counsel for the District to determine its 
validity [5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1].  "Collective, negotiating matters between 
the public body and its employees or their representative, or deliberation 
concerning the salary schedules for one or more classes of employees. "[5 
ILCS 120/2(2)(2)].  Litigation, when an action against, affecting or on 
behalf of the particular public body has been filed and is pending before 
a court or administrative tribunal, or when the public body finds than an 
action is probable or imminent, in which case the basis for the finding 
shall be recorded and when entered into the minutes of the closed meeting. 
5 ILCS 120/2(c)(11).

B. Open Session



C. Action Items from Closed Session
D. Adjourn





































































Central School District #301  

Transportation Department 
Edward E. Lemcke “Rusty” - Director of Transportation 

P.O. Box 396, 44W303 Plato Road, Burlington, Illinois   60109   

  847-464-6018 / 847-464-6051 Fax 

 

 

 

  January 12, 2016 
 

 

 

 

TO:                 Todd Stirn 

 

FROM:           Rusty Lemcke 

 

Ref:                 Bus Bids for 2016-2017 

 

 

Bus bids were mailed to three bus manufacturers, Midwest Transit was the only 

manufacturer to submit a bid for the two year lease. The district has worked with 

Midwest for the past several years and are very happy with their service. 

 

Midwest is offering an early signing bonus of $500.00 per bus for the first year of the 

lease. This would be savings of $7000.00 for the 15 buses leased for the first year.  Please 

see the breakdown on Midwest’s bid. 

 

It is my recommendation that we accept the bid from Midwest Transit, and take 

advantage of the early signing bonus. 

 

Should you have question or concerns please contact me. 

 
                                            

 

 

 



BID TABULATION 
January 8, 2016 

 
SCHOOL BUS LEASE
CENTRAL COMMUNITY UNIT SCHOOL DISTRICT 301
BURLINGTON, IL  60109

First Year Lease 2016-2017* Qty *Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Inc. Central States Bus Sales

72 passenger school bus, 16,000 miles per year 7 $10,235.00 No Bid No Bid
28 passenger school buses with seat belts, air
conditioning , 20,000 miles per year 7 $8,012.00 No Bid No Bid
18-2 Wheel Chair Buses, air conditioning,
20,000 miles per year. 1 $8,736.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL $26,983.00 $0.00 $0.00

$500.00 per bus discount if total bid is accepted

Second Year Lease 2017-2018* Qty Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Inc. Central States Bus Sales

72 passenger school bus, 16,000 miles per year 7 $10,235.00 No Bid No Bid
28 passenger school buses with seat belts, air
conditioning , 20,000 miles per year 7 $8,012.00 No Bid No Bid
18-2 Wheel Chair Buses, air conditioning,
20,000 miles per year. 1 $8,736.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL $26,983.00



BID TABULATION:  FOOTBALL FIELD BLEACHERS
                             CENTRAL HIGH SCHOOL
                             CENTRAL COMMUNITY UNIT SCHOOL DISTRICT 301
                             BURLINGTON, IL  60109

COMPLETE WORK:
BIDDER    

BID SECURITY

PROPOSAL #1
TIME OF COMPLETION
VOLUNTARY ALTERNATE

PROPOSAL #2
TIME OF COMPLETION
VOLUNTARY ALTERNATE



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: ADVANCED PLACEMENT COMPUTER SCIENCE   

DATE: 1/19/2016 

 

In accordance with requirements from the State Board of Education, I am requesting 

Board action on the following: 

 

 “If a school district offers an Advanced Placement computer science 

 course to high school students, then the school board must designate 

 that course as equivalent to a high school mathematics course and must 

 denote on the student’s transcript that the Advanced Placement computer 

 science course qualifies as a mathematics-based, quantitative course for  

 students.” 

 

Course (1115: AP Computer Science A) is currently offered through the CTE department 

and we are recommending that it be moved to be offered under the mathematics 

department as well. Currently the prerequisite for this course is the recommendation for 

completion of Algebra 2 and Introduction to Computer Programming. This 

recommendation will not change. Upon approval, we will be publishing this course in the 

2016-2017 Central High School Curriculum Guide under both CTE and Mathematics, 

however, it will state that this course will be given mathematics credit.    

 



                BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM  

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 
FROM: DR. TODD STIRN, SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: REVIEW EXECUTIVE SESSION MINUTES FROM JULY 2015 – DECEMBER 2016 

DATE: 1/19/15 

 

Issues addressed in executive session from July 2015 – December 2015 covered items 

related to personnel, items related to negotiations with CEA and BEST, litigation, student 

disciplinary cases, and setting the price for sale or lease of property owned by the district. 

The personnel reports, and building lease information should be released for public review. 

Any minutes related to student discipline, contract negotiation, or pending litigation will be 

kept closed and not released for public review.  The agendas and personnel reports from 

July 2015 to December 2015 are included with this memo.   









































               BOARD OF EDUCATION MEMORANDUM 

 

 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: MIKE POTSIC, DIRECTOR OF STUDENT SERVICES   

SUBJECT: EARLY CHILDHOOD BLENDED PROGRAM 

DATE: JANUARY 19, 2016 

 

Early Childhood Blended Program 
 

 2015-2016 School Year 2016-2017 School Year 

Teachers 5 Full-Time Teachers 5 Full-Time Teachers 

Sections 2 sections/teacher 2 sections/teacher 

8 Instructional sections 

Class size: up to 10 students 
At least 2 Instructional sections 

Class size: up to 10 students 

2 Blended sections 

Class size: 15 students 
Up to 8 Blended sections: depending 

upon enrollment 

Class size: 15 students 

IEP students 56 IEP students Projected: 41 IEP students (20 AM, 21 

PM) 

Gen Ed students 20 General Education students Projected: up to 80 students 

Transportation Provided to all students ● Provided to all IEP students 

● Families provide for General 

Education students 

Tuition No charge except registration fee ($50) ● $250/month (up to 80 students = 

$160,000)  

● Plus registration fee ($50) 

 

Student/Teacher Materials: 

Provided through the Pre-School IDEA Grant 

 

Blended Classroom Furniture: 

Additional Chairs and table = $1100 

 

 

 



Assessment Materials:  

Teaching Strategies Gold (30 more) = $658 

Individual Growth and Development Indicators (IGDIs) = $120 

 

Staffing Needs: 

Replace retiring teacher 

Currently 1.2 FTE Speech Therapist:  

-Increase to 2.0 FTE Speech Therapist: salary $40,000 plus benefits $11,000 

Currently .5 FTE Occupational Therapist: Increase to .7 FTE OT: cost $20,000 

Currently 1.0 FTE School Psychologist: covers HBT and EC coordination: 

-Increase .5 FTE EC Coordinator/Assistant Principal: salary $40,000 plus benefits 

$11,000 

 

Professional Development:  

Provided through the Pre-School IDEA Grant and District Budget 

 

Revenue Expenditures 

  Furniture  $1100 

Tuition $160,000 Assessment materials $778 

  Staffing needs  $122,000  

 

Total $160,000 Total $123,878 

 

Rationale: Inclusion is the principle that supports the education of children with 

disabilities alongside their non-disabled peer rather than separately.  Both the American 

with Disabilities Act (ADA) and Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act require school and 

agencies to provide equal education opportunities for children with disabilities.  

Educational research shows that children with disabilities who attend preschool in 

inclusive environments demonstrate gains in social skills, self-regulation, language 

development, and cognition.  Preschool classrooms that utilize inclusive materials and 

curricula, along with appropriate supports and services, provide social and educational 

benefits to the general preschool population as well. Additionally, children who attend 

high quality preschool programs demonstrate gains in early learning skills and throughout 

their K-12 years. 

 

2015-16 Pilot Blended Classroom Current Highlights:  

 Increased peer interactions and social skills 

 Improvement in language development 

 Increase in self-confidence and empathy 

 Student dismissed from special education and reduced need for speech services 

 Individual Growth and Development (IGDI’s) Data 



EARLY CHILDHOOD BLENDED 
PROGRAM
Andrea Bonk – Speech-Language Pathologist
Colleen Feeney – EC Teacher
Mike Potsic – Director of Student Services

January 19, 2016



  2015-2016 School Year 2016-2017 School Year

Teachers 5 Full-Time Teachers 5 Full-Time Teachers

Sections 2 sections/teacher 2 sections/teacher

8 Instructional sections
Class size: up to 10 students

At least 2 Instructional sections
Class size: up to 10 students

2 Blended sections
Class size: 15 students

Up to 8 Blended sections: 
depending upon enrollment
Class size: 15 students

IEP students 56 IEP students Projected: 41 IEP students (20 
AM, 21 PM)

Gen Ed students 20 General Education 
students

Projected: up to 80 students

Transportation Provided to all students ● Provided to all IEP 
students

● Families provide for 
General Education 
students

Tuition No charge except registration 
fee ($50)

● $250/month (up to 80 
students = $160,000) 

● Plus registration fee ($50)

Early Childhood Blended Program



Early Childhood Blended Program Needs:

   Student/Teacher Materials:
 Provided through the Pre-School IDEA Grant

   Blended Classroom Furniture:
 Additional Chairs and table = $1100

   Assessment Materials: 
 Teaching Strategies Gold (30 more) = $658
 Individual Growth and Development Indicators (IGDIs) = $120

     



   Staffing Needs:
Replace retiring teacher
Currently 1.2 FTE Speech Therapist: 

-Increase to 2.0 FTE Speech Therapist: salary $40,000 plus   
benefits $11,000

Currently .5 FTE Occupational Therapist: Increase to .7 FTE 
OT:  cost $20,000

Currently 1.0 FTE School Psychologist: covers HBT and EC 
coordination:

-Increase .5 FTE EC Coordinator/Assistant Principal: salary 
$40,000 plus benefits $11,000

   Professional Development: 
 Provided through the Pre-School IDEA Grant and District Budget



Revenue Expenditures

    Furniture $1100

Tuition $160,000 Assessment 
materials

$778

    Staffing 
needs 

$122,000 
 

Total $160,000 Total $123,878

Program Costs:



Rationale: 
 Inclusion is the principle that supports the education of children 

with disabilities alongside their non-disabled peer rather than 
separately

 Both the American with Disabilities Act (ADA) and Section 504 of 
the Rehabilitation Act require school and agencies to provide 
equal education opportunities for children with disabilities

 Educational research shows that children with disabilities who 
attend preschool in inclusive environments demonstrate gains in 
social skills, self-regulation, language development, and 
cognition

 Preschool classrooms that utilize inclusive materials and curricula, 
along with appropriate supports and services, provide social and 
educational benefits to the general preschool population as well

 Additionally, children who attend high quality preschool 
programs demonstrate gains in early learning skills and 
throughout their K-12 years



Rationale Continued…
U.S. News and World Report (January 2016): 

“Kindergarten is the New First Grade”
*That's the big finding from researchers at the 
University of Virginia who compared 
kindergarten and first-grade classrooms between 
1998 and 2010, and found that over the 12-year 
period, kindergarten classes have become 
startlingly like first grade

Illinois State Board of Education wants to look at 
pre-school opportunities for all children

Pre-school opportunities mentioned in President’s 
State of the Union Address

http://ero.sagepub.com/content/2/1/2332858415616358


Supports District Priorities:
Success by Six

-Kindergarten readiness

All Day Kindergarten
Strong focus on Numeracy and Literacy in early years
3 by 3

-By the end of third grade all students reading at the 3rd grade 
level



2015-16 Pilot Blended Classroom Highlights: 
Increased peer interactions and social skills
Improvement in language development
Increase in self-confidence and empathy
Student dismissed from special education and 

reduced need for speech services
Individual Growth and Development (IGDI’s) Data



Questions?

Provide additional Information / Data 
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To:        Dr. Todd E. Stirn 
              Superintendent of Schools 
              Central Community USD 301 Schools 
 
From:   Pamela J. Mirenda 
             Director of Food Services 
             Central Community USD 301 Schools 
 
RE:        Lunch Prices for SY 2016-17 
 
Date:    January 13, 2016 
 
 
I am recommending the Paid Lunch Prices for the SY 2016-17 be increased as follows: 
 
                                                      SY 2015-16                  SY 2016-17 
High School                 from          $2.80             to             $2.90        increase of $.10 
Middle Schools           from          $2.75             to             $2.80        increase of $.05 
Elementary Schools   from          $2.65             to             $2.70        increase of $.05 
 
Reduced Price Lunches will remain the same:  $.40 per lunch 
Milk Prices will remain the same:  $.40 per ½ pint                          
Adult / Teacher Lunch will be $3.25   an increase of $.25 
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