
School Board Meeting
October 19, 2017 6:30 PM
HJSHS Library

Attendance Taken at 6:29 PM. 
Rev. Mark Hodge:   Present   
Mr. Terry Johnson:   Absent   
Mr. Wayne McLemore:   Present   
Mr. Leon McNeal:   Present   
Ms. Valeria Wedley:   Present   
Also present: Dr. Versie Hamlett, Superintendent
Attendance Update Taken at 6:32 PM. 
Mr. Phillip Hardee:   Present   
Mr. Chuck Samples:   Present   

I. Call to Order
II. Roll Call
III. Consent Agenda
Motion to approve the Consent Agenda as presented passed with a motion 
by Mr. Chuck Samples and a second by Mr. Wayne McLemore.
Mr. Phillip 
Hardee:   Yea   

Mr. Terry 
Johnson:   Absent   

Mr. Wayne 
McLemore:   Yea   

Mr. Leon McNeal:   Absent   
Mr. Chuck 
Samples:   Yea   

Yea: 3, Nay: 0, Absent: 2
A. September 2017 Bills
B. September 2017 Financial Report
C. September 7, 2017 Regular Board Meeting
IV. Agenda Approval
Motion to approve the agenda passed with a motion by Mr. Chuck Samples 
and a second by Mr. Wayne McLemore.
Mr. Phillip 
Hardee:   Yea   

Mr. Terry 
Johnson:   Absent   

Mr. Wayne 
McLemore:   Yea   

Mr. Leon McNeal:   Absent   
Mr. Chuck 
Samples:   Yea   

Yea: 3, Nay: 0, Absent: 2
V. Regular Agenda
A. Board Policy Updates - 1st Reading
The following board policies were presented for the first reading:
• 1.901 Charter School Applications
• 4.700 Testing Programs



• 5.117 Teacher Tenure
• 6.2011 Voluntary Pre-K Attendance

1. 1.901 Charter School Applications
2. 4.700 Testing Programs
3. 5.117 Teacher Tenure
4. 6.2011 Voluntary Pre-K Attendance
B. Advanced Manufacturing Bids 2017-18
Motion to accept the bid from Airgas Option #1 for the Plasma Cutting 
Table and Jeffreys MFG for the Mill and Lathe passed with a motion by 
Mr. Chuck Samples and a second by Mr. Wayne McLemore.
Mr. Phillip 
Hardee:   Yea   

Mr. Terry 
Johnson:   Absent   

Mr. Wayne 
McLemore:   Yea   

Mr. Leon McNeal:   Yea   
Mr. Chuck 
Samples:   Yea   

Yea: 4, Nay: 0, Absent: 1
C. Superintendent's Report
The Superintendent's Report consisted of:
• A presentation on the data received from TNReady with more news 

being released on Friday that will be shared.
1. TNReady Report
2. Personnel Report
The Board was updated as to the personnel changes that have taken place 
since the September Board Meeting.

VI. Citizens Concern
VII. Adjournment
Motion to adjourn passed with a motion by Mr. Chuck Samples and a 
second by Mr. Leon McNeal.
Mr. Phillip 
Hardee:   Yea   

Mr. Terry 
Johnson:   Absent   

Mr. Wayne 
McLemore:   Yea   

Mr. Leon McNeal:   Yea   
Mr. Chuck 
Samples:   Yea   

Yea: 4, Nay: 0, Absent: 1



___________________________________________________________              
Chairman Date

___________________________________________________________             
Superintendent Date



 

 

School Board Meeting 

September 07, 2017 6:30 PM 

HJSHS Library 

 

Attendance Taken at 6:29 PM:  

 

Present Board Members:    

Mr. Terry Johnson  

Mr. Wayne McLemore  

Mr. Leon McNeal  

Mr. Chuck Samples  

  

Absent Board Members:    

Mr. Phillip Hardee  

 

 

Also present:  Dr. Versie Hamlett, Superintendent 

 

I. Call to Order   

 

II. Roll Call   

 

III. Consent Agenda   

 

Motion Passed:  Motion to approve the Consent Agenda as presented passed with a 

motion by Mr. Chuck Samples and a second by Mr. Wayne McLemore.   

 

4 Yeas - 0 Nays.   

 

Mr. Phillip Hardee        Absent 

Mr. Terry Johnson         Yes 

Mr. Wayne McLemore        Yes 

Mr. Leon McNeal           Yes 

Mr. Chuck Samples         Yes 

 

III.A. August 2017 Bills   

III.B. August 2017 Financial Report   

III.C. August 10, 2017 Regular Board Meeting   

 

IV. Agenda Approval   

 

Motion Passed:  Motion to approve the agenda passed with a motion by Mr. Chuck 

Samples and a second by Mr. Leon McNeal.   

 

4 Yeas - 0 Nays.   

 

Mr. Phillip Hardee        Absent 

Mr. Terry Johnson         Yes 

Mr. Wayne McLemore        Yes 

Mr. Leon McNeal           Yes 

Mr. Chuck Samples         Yes 

 

 

V. Regular Agenda   

 

V.A. Board Policy Updates - 2nd Reading   

 



 

 

Motion Passed:  Motion to approve all policies omitting 2.806 as amended passed 

with a motion by Mr. Chuck Samples and a second by Mr. Leon McNeal.   

 

4 Yeas - 0 Nays.   

 

Mr. Phillip Hardee        Absent 

Mr. Terry Johnson         Yes 

Mr. Wayne McLemore        Yes 

Mr. Leon McNeal           Yes 

Mr. Chuck Samples         Yes 

 

V.A.1. 1.407 School District Records   

V.A.2. 2.703 Audits   

V.A.3. 3.202 Emergency Preparedness Plan   

V.A.4. 3.400 Student Transportation Management   

V.A.5. 4.210 Credit Recovery   

V.A.6. 4.301 Interscholastic Athletics   

V.A.7. 4.302 Field Trip and Excursions   

V.A.8. 4.402 Instructional Supplies   

V.A.9. 4.600 Grading System   

V.A.10. 4.700 Testing Programs   

V.A.11. 5.200 Separation Practices for Tenured Teachers, 5.201 Separation 

Practices for Non-Tenured Teachers, 5.701 Substitute Teachers   

V.A.12. 5.203 Recommendations and File Transfers   

V.A.13. 5.600 Staff Rights and Responsibilities   

 

V.B. Superintendent's Report   

  

The Superintendent's Report consisted of: 

• Congratulations to Ginny Hatch, Food Service Director, and her staff at 

all three cafeterias for making 100 on their food inspection. 

• Grandparents' Day Luncheon is Friday, Sept. 8th at Stigall at 10:30 and 

Monday, Sept. 11th at East Elem. at 10:30-12:00. 

• CASA begins on Monday, Sept. 11th. 

• Vikings Gala is Saturday, Sept. 23rd. 

• The Fall District Meeting is Sept. 26th at Huntingdon High School 

beginning at 5:00. 

• Homecoming activities will be Sept. 29th.  

 

V.B.1. Personnel Report   

  

The Board was updated as to the personnel changes that have taken place since 

the August Board Meeting.  

 

VI. Citizens Concern   

 

VII. Adjournment   

 

Motion Passed:  Motion to adjourn passed with a motion by Mr. Chuck Samples and 

a second by Mr. Leon McNeal.   

 

4 Yeas - 0 Nays.   

 

Mr. Phillip Hardee        Absent 

Mr. Terry Johnson         Yes 

Mr. Wayne McLemore        Yes 



 

 

Mr. Leon McNeal           Yes 

Mr. Chuck Samples         Yes 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

_____________________________________    

Phillip Hardee, Chairman     Date  

 

 

  

 

_____________________________________    

Dr. Versie Hamlett, Superintendent   Date 

























 
Humboldt City Schools 

Board of Education 
2602 Viking Drive 

Humboldt, Tennessee 38343 

Phone 731-784-2652 ● Fax 731-784-2480 

 
 

Date: 10/4/2017 

To: Dr. Versie Hamlett, Superintendent 

From: Wayne Sheehan, CTE Director 

RE: Advanced Manufacturing Bids 2017-18 

On October 3, 2017, bid openings were held for CNC Mill, CNC Lathe, and Plasma Cutting Table.  
The following vendors provided bids: 

1. Mill 

Airgas  $  No Bid 

Jeffreys MFG     $ 36,345.00 

Lincoln  $  No Bid 

2. Lathe 

Airgas  $ No Bid 

Jeffreys MFG     $ 38,870.00 

Lincoln  $ No Bid 

3. Plasma Cutting Table 

Airgas  $ 26,198.67    Option #1   Setup included 

  $ 30,048.13    Option # 2   ($6,000.00 on-site setup additional.) 

Jeffreys MFG     $ No Bid 

Lincoln  $ $ 34,805.63    ($6,000.00 on-site setup additional.) 

 

I recommend that we accept the bid for all equipment from Airgas Option #1 for the Plasma 
Cutting Table and Jeffreys MFG for the Mill and Lathe. 

 

Money is from the Governor’s State Budget for CTE Equipment.   
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