
Board Work Session
March 12, 2024 4:00 PM

Collierville Schools Administrative Office - Upstairs Conference Room
215 West Poplar Avenue

Collierville, TN 38017

I. Call to Order Wright Cox, Chairman
II. Roll Call Wright Cox, Chairman
III. Business Items for Approval

A. February 2024 Financial Statement Anita Floyd, Chief Financial Officer
B. Policy #6.3122 Student Responsible Use Lisa Higgins, Chief Technology 

Officer
C. Apple Purchase of 75 laptops including warranty and 
cases

Lisa Higgins, Chief Technology 
Officer

D. Apple Lease - Teacher Ipads, Ipads for Kindergarden, 3rd 
grade and 6th grade, Laptops for 9th grade

Lisa Higgins, Chief Technology 
Officer

E. Resolution 2024-15 The execution and delivery of a 
Master Lease Purchase Agreement with Apple, Inc
F. Furniture Purchase for Collierville High School new 
addition from Knowledge Tree, per Sourcewell Contract 
#091423 

Robert Morris, Operations 
Supervisor

G. Final GMP for West Collierville Middle School Interior 
Renovations awarded to Chris Woods Construction - 
Placeholder

Robert Morris, Operations 
Supervisor

H. Bid # FY24012 Painting Projects at Bailey Station 
Elementary School and Collierville High School with 
recommended award to Xpert Painting, Inc.

Robert Morris, Operations 
Supervisor

IV. Adjournment































































































































































































































































































































Version Date: November 24, 2020

Collierville Schools Board of Education
Descriptor Code:

6.3122
Issued Date:

06/28/22
Monitoring:

Review: Annually, in 
June

Descriptor Term:

Student Responsible Use 
Rescinds:

6.3122
Issued:

12/08/20
03/21/17

1 Filtered Internet access is available for all students only as an educational resource. 

2 • I will not go to websites that are not appropriate for learning.  
3 • I will inform a teacher immediately if any inappropriate sites are accessed while I am online.  
4 • I will not attempt to bypass the Internet filter to access a blocked website.  
5 • I will not remotely access computers outside the system’s network.  
6 • While in Kindergarten – Second grade, I will only go to websites the teacher provides for me.

7 *This policy also applies to all district-issued devices regardless of physical location or network 
8 connection.  

9 The devices (computer, and iPad), software, and network are available for all students only as an 
10 educational resource.  

11 • I will treat all devices, and hardware with respect and not cause damage to them.  
12 • I will not share my usernames and passwords with anyone nor will I use another student’s 
13 username and password.  
14 • I will not share my device, charger, or other school-issued equipment with others. 
15 • I will not access, alter, or delete another person’s information/files on any device.  
16 • I will follow copyright law in my projects and give credit to my resources (authors and/or 
17 websites).  
18 • I understand that teachers and administrators may monitor all student activities on the network 
19 and devices, on and off campus. 
20 • I may be assigned individual email and network accounts and must use only those accounts on 
21 district devices.  All account activity should be for educational use only.  
22 • I will not use the device to illegally distribute, install, or reproduce copyrighted materials.  
23 • I will not use the device to facilitate any illegal activity or use it for commercial or for-profit 
24 use.  
25 • I will not use the network to attempt to gain unauthorized or unlawful access to other devices, 
26 systems, or accounts.  
27 • I will not utilize school district or individual school names, logos, or trademarks without 
28 permission.  
29 • I understand that students are responsible for storing and backing up their own data.  

30 School-issued devices are set-up and the software programs are selected for all students only as an 
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1 education resource.  

2 • I will not download, install, or remove software/apps or media without permission and 
3 direction from a teacher.  
4 • I will not personalize the external appearance of my school-issued device.  
5 • I will not change the district settings on my device.  
6 • I will immediately notify my teacher, the building level technology coordinator, or designee if I 
7 identify a security problem or other issue on a technological resource, and I will not 
8 demonstrate the problem to others.  

9 Good Digital Citizenship should be practiced on and off campus. 

10 • I will only use online communication (email, instant messaging, chat rooms, blogs, wikis, etc.) 
11 for educational purposes on school-issued devices. 
12 • I understand that all school-issued email communications are stored and may be accessed and 
13 examined by teachers and administrators at any time. 
14 • There is no expectation of privacy for the device or email.
15 • I will always use proper and appropriate language and my best writing skills (including 
16 adhering to copyright policies). 
17 • I will never give or post personal information (my name, address, telephone number, etc.) to 
18 someone online. 
19 • I will never use online communication to harass or bully anyone. 
20 • I will not engage in creating, intentionally viewing, accessing, downloading, storing, printing, 
21 or transmitting content that is obscene, profane, pornographic, harassing, abusive, or considered 
22 harmful to minors. 
23 • I understand that I should not share or post pictures or recordings of other individuals without 
24 their consent (or parental consent for minors). 

25 If I don’t follow the Responsible Use Policy (RUP):  

26 • I may lose the privilege of using computers, iPads, and/or the Internet at school.  
27 • I may lose the privilege of taking a device off-campus, if applicable.
28 • I understand that I may will be held financially responsible for any deliberate or negligent 
29 damage to equipment and for loss or theft of the equipment while in my possession or when I 
30 am charged with its care (see below).  
31 • I understand that if a device under my care is broken twice within a school year, I will be held 
32 financially responsible for the total replacement value or repair of the device, warranty and 
33 case, for any subsequent damage. 
34 • I understand that the administration will determine disciplinary and/or financial consequences 
35 for Responsible Use Policy (RUP) violations.  
36 • I understand that certain willful misuse may result in criminal prosecution under applicable 
37 state and federal law.  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1 Digital Resource Guide:

2 Additional information, details, and examples regarding the RUP and Collierville Schools technology 
3 resources and guidelines are found in the Digital Resource Guide on our district website. Parents and 
4 students are responsible for the content of the Digital Resource Guide in addition to the RUP. Families 
5 may request a hard copy of the Guide at any time. 

6 RUP AND WEB APPLICATIONS GUIDE SIGNATURE PAGE 

7 Legal ownership of the device belongs to Collierville Schools (CS). The student’s right to use and 
8 possess the device is terminated upon withdrawal from Collierville Schools. The failure to timely return 
9 the property and the continued use of it for non-school purposes without the school system’s consent 

10 will be considered unlawful appropriation or theft of the school system’s property. 

11 Loss or theft of the device must be reported to the CS District immediately. In the event CS has to resort 
12 to legal action to recover an electronic device, the undersigned parent or guardian agrees to pay the 
13 reasonable attorney’s fees and costs of CS incurred in such effort. 

14 As the parent/guardian, my signature indicates I agree to abide by the conditions listed in the CS 
15 Responsible Use Policy (RUP) as well as the content provided in the Resource Guide. Failure to honor 
16 the terms of this Policy may result in the denial of Internet and other electronic media accessibility. 
17 Furthermore, the student may be subject to disciplinary action, and, if applicable, the device may be 
18 recalled. I give my permission for my child to have access to the described electronic resources and have 
19 access to the Internet, including an email account.

20 I understand that some objectionable materials may be accessed even with District content filtering in 
21 place. I understand that individuals and families may be held liable for violations. I will accept 
22 responsibility for guidance of Internet use by setting and conveying standards for my son/daughter to 
23 follow when exploring on-line information and media on an independent basis. Collierville Schools 
24 cannot be responsible for ideas and concepts that my child may gain by his or her inappropriate use of 
25 the Internet.

26 I understand and accept the conditions stated and agree to release, indemnify, and hold harmless, 
27 Collierville, Collierville Board of Education, and/or their employees or agents from any and all claims 
28 and liability associated with or arising from the above student’s independent use and/or access to the 
29 Internet.

30 Parent/Guardian Name (please print): _______________________________Date: _____________ 

31 Parent/Guardian Signature: __________________________________________________________

32 As the student, my signature indicates that I have received, read, and agree to follow the CS Responsible 
33 Use Policy and have been made aware of and intend to follow the full Resource Guide. I agree to the 
34 terms and conditions outlined and in return will have conditional access to the described electronic 
35 resources, including an email account. 
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1 Student Name (please print): ____________________________________ Date: ____________ 

2 Student Signature:_____________________________________________________________

3 MEDIA RELEASE PERMISSION 

4 In compliance with the federal Family Educational Rights and Privacy Act (FERPA, 
5 http://www.ed.gov/policy/gen/guid/fpco/ferpa/index.html), Collierville Schools notifies parents 
6 annually about release of student information (Parent/Student Handbooks, District Website, and/or this 
7 RUP). The following applies to release of information to the media or other publicly available 
8 information sources: 

9 1. GENERAL MEDIA RELEASE: The school or district may feature my child’s likeness 
10 (photograph, video, etc.) and/or work on Collierville Schools’ online resources, in publications, 
11 or other public media. No last names or other personal demographic information will appear with 
12 any student likeness or work except as set forth below. 

13 2. EXCEPTION for HONORS and AWARDS: For the purpose of publicly recognizing students 
14 for honor and awards, the school district will assume implied consent to release student 
15 information (including first and last name) unless a parent or guardian notifies Collierville 
16 Schools within ten (10) calendar days after the first day of school (or the first day of enrollment). 
17 Student information related to honors and awards may appear in broadcast, print or digital media, 
18 in both district and non-district information sources. 

19 3. PARENTAL APPROVAL for UNIQUE SITUATIONS: Should the school or school district 
20 wish to use a student’s name, image or work for purposes other than as noted above, school 
21 officials will seek parental approval in advance. 
22 As the parent or legal guardian of the minor student signing above or as a student 18 years of age or 
23 older, I have read the Responsible Use Policy and Media Coverage. I grant permission for this student.

24 Parent Signature: _____________________________________________Date: ________________



Apple Inc. Education Price Quote

Customer: Lisa Higgins 
COLLIERVILLE SCHOOLS 
Phone: 901-286-6711 
email: lhiggins@colliervilleschools.org

Apple Inc: Kameron Ball
email: kameron_ball@apple.com

Apple Quote: 2212658263
   

Quote Date: Thursday, March 07, 2024    

Quote Valid Until: Saturday, April 06, 2024    

Quote Comments:  

# Product Description Qty Unit List Price Extended List Price

1 13-inch MacBook Air: Apple M2 chip with 8-core
CPU and 10-core GPU, 512GB - Space Gray with 4-
Year AppleCare+ for Schools (Packaged in a 5-
pack) (No Service Fee)
Part Number BTT92LL/A

13-inch MacBook Air: Apple M2 chip with 8-core CPU
and 10-core GPU, 512GB - Space Gray (Packaged in a 5-
pack)
Part Number: MLY83LL/A
Quantity: 75

4-Year AppleCare+ for Schools 13-inch MacBook Air
(M2) (no service fees)
Part Number: SEY12LL/A
Quantity: 75

15 $6,540.00 $98,100.00

2 Brenthaven 360 case for MacBook Air 13-in. (M2) -
Special 5-pack Pricing (contains qty. 5
HQ7C2ZM/A)
Part Number BVRL2LL/A

Brenthaven 360 case for MacBook Air 13-in. (M2)
Part Number: HQ7C2ZM/A
Quantity: 75

15 $224.75 $3,371.25

3 APS MAC PACKAGE3 DEPLOY SERVICES-USA
Part Number DA3K2LL/A

75 $25.00 $1,875.00

   

Edu List Price Total $103,346.25

- Additional Tax $0.00

- Estimated Tax $0.00



Extended Total Price* $103,346.25

*In most cases Extended discounted Total price does not
include Sales Tax
*If applicable, eWaste/Recycling Fees are included. Standard
shipping is complimentary

Complete your order by one of the following:

This document has been created for you as Apple Quote ID 2212658263. Please contact your institution's Authorized Purchaser to
submit the above quote online. For account access or new account registration, go to https://ecommerce.apple.com. Simply go to the
Quote area of your Apple Education Online Store, click on it and convert to an order.

For registration assistance, call 1.800.800.2775

THIS IS A QUOTE FOR THE SALE OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES. YOUR USE OF THIS QUOTE IS SUBJECT TO THE FOLLOWING PROVISIONS WHICH CAN CHANGE
ON SUBSEQUENT QUOTES:

A. ANY ORDER THAT YOU PLACE IN RESPONSE TO THIS QUOTE WILL BE GOVERNED BY (1) ANY CONTRACT IN EFFECT BETWEEN APPLE INC. ("APPLE")
AND YOU AT THE TIME YOU PLACE THE ORDER OR (2), IF YOU DO NOT HAVE A CONTRACT IN EFFECT WITH APPLE, CONTACT
contracts@apple.com.

B. ALL SALES ARE FINAL. PLEASE REVIEW RETURN POLICY BELOW IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS. IF YOU USE YOUR INSTITUTION'S PURCHASE ORDER
FORM TO PLACE AN ORDER IN RESPONSE TO THIS QUOTE, APPLE REJECTS ANY TERMS SET OUT ON THE PURCHASE ORDER THAT ARE
INCONSISTENT WITH OR IN ADDITION TO THE TERMS OF YOUR AGREEMENT WITH APPLE.

C. UNLESS THIS QUOTE SPECIFIES OTHERWISE, IT REMAINS IN EFFECT UNTIL Saturday, April 06, 2024 UNLESS APPLE WITHDRAWS IT BEFORE YOU
PLACE AN ORDER, BY SENDING NOTICE OF ITS INTENTION TO WITHDRAW THE QUOTE TO YOUR ADDRESS SET OUT IN THE QUOTE.

APPLE MAY MODIFY OR CANCEL ANY PROVISION OF THIS QUOTE, OR CANCEL ANY ORDER YOU PLACE PURSUANT TO THIS QUOTE, IF IT
CONTAINS A TYPOGRAPHIC OR OTHER ERROR.

D. THE AMOUNT OF THE VOLUME PURCHASE PROGRAM (VPP) CREDIT SHOWN ON THIS QUOTE WILL ALWAYS BE AT UNIT LIST PRICE VALUE DURING
REDEMPTION ON THE VPP STORE.

E. UNLESS SPECIFIED ABOVE, APPLE'S STANDARD SHIPPING IS INCLUDED IN THE TOTAL PRICE.

Opportunity ID: 18000011389707
https://ecommerce.apple.com

Fax:

Terms & Use | Privacy Policy | Return Policy
Copyright © 2016 Apple Inc. All rights reserved. 

Document rev 10.6.1 Date of last revision - June 20th, 2016
 

https://ecommerce.apple.com/
mailto:contracts@apple.com
https://ecommerce.apple.com/
http://www.apple.com/legal/
http://www.apple.com/legal/privacy/
https://ecommerce.apple.com/content/b2b/static/en/us/edu-hied/acceptance.html


















































5000 Summer Ave, Suite 101
Memphis, TN   38122
DATE 3.1.2024

Collierville High School
11605 E. Shelby Drive
Collierville, TN 38017

Attn: Thomas Dougherty

New Additions Educational Classrooms (17)
Line # Tag Item# Description Qty Price Ext. Price

1
F1A 
and 
F1B

IWC18

Intellect Wave Cantilever Chair, Large
*Frame Color: Starlight Silver Metallic
*Shell Color: Blue Grey (Qty 253)
*Shell Color: Pantone PMS-505C (Qty 253)
*Felt Solo Glide 

506 100.00$         50,600.00$                       

2 F2 IWDCH/29/EBH

Intellect Wave Cantilever Desk, 29"H, Hard Plastic Top
*Frame Color: Starlight Silver Metallic
*Plastic Top Color: Kensington Maple
*Book Bag Hooks (2)
*Felt Solo Glide

506 216.00$         109,296.00$                     

Subtotal 159,896.00$                     

3 F4 KIDE82B

Diem Teacher Task Chair
*Backrest Color: TBD
*Fabric Grade 3: TBD
*Weight-Activated
*With 1 D Arms
*Black Plastic Base

17 400.00$         6,800.00$                         

SUBTOTAL 6,800.00$                         

4 F7 CUSTOMTEACHERDESK

Teacher Station
*Worksurface - L Shape
*Box/Box/File Pedestal
*Privacy Screen
*Overhead Cabinet with Steel Door
*Metal Bookcase

17 3,165.00$      53,805.00$                       

Subtotal 53,805.00$                       

5 F6 S7L/36660HX

KI Series 700 Metal Storage Cabinet
*(36"W x 18"D 70"Ht)
*Unit Color: Blue Grey
*Pull: Classic Inset
*Adjustable Shelves

17 1,050.00$      17,850.00$                       

SUBTOTAL 17,850.00$                       

6 B3 2021G-25

Porcelain Steel White Markerboard
*(4' x 6')
*Aluminum Trim
*Tackable Map Rail - Top
*Full Length Marker Tray with End Caps

34 550.00$         18,700.00$                       

SUBTOTAL 18,700.00$                       

7 B4 302AH
Natural Cork Tackboard with Aluminum Trim
*(48" x 96")
*Natural Add - Cork

17 340.00$         5,780.00$                         

SUBTOTAL 5,780.00$                         

SUBTOTAL 262,831.00$             

QUOTE



Aviation Classrooms (2)
Line # Tag Item# Description Qty Price Ext. Price

1 F50 P7244M36N

Diversified Spaces Lab Plain Tables
*(36" x 72")
*Fixed Height: 36"
*Phenolic Black Top
*Wood: Maple
*Stain: Northwoods
*Wood Square Legs
*Non-Skid Glids and Rubber Leg Boots

6 1,200.00$      7,200.00$                         

2
F60 
and 
F66

IWS

KI Intellect Wave Student and Teacher Large Stool
*Poly Color: Blue Grey
*With Foot Ring
*Adjustable Height: 20.5" to 30.75"

25 215.00$         5,375.00$                         

3 F40 GSC-36

Diversified Spaces Tall General Storage Cabinet
*(36"W x 22"D x 84"Ht)
*Fixed Bottom and Middle Shelf with Four Adjustable 
Shelves
*Maple
*With Lock

6 1,700.00$      10,200.00$                       

4 F55 P255F-74P

KI Portico Rectangle Table
*(30" x 60")
*T-Base - Fixed Height
*Laminate: Kensington Ma;e
*Base: Starlight Silver Metallic
*74P Edge: Kensington Maple

16 685.00$         10,960.00$                       

5 F1 IWC18

Intellect Wave Cantilever Chair, Large
*Frame: Starlight Silver Metallic
*Shell Color: Blue Grey
*Felt Solo Glide

32 100.00$         3,200.00$                         

Subtotal 36,935.00$                       

6 F4 KIDE82B

Diem Teacher Task Chair
*Backrest Color: TBD
*Fabric Grade 3: TBD
*Weight-Activated
*With 1 D Arms
*Black Plastic Base

1 400.00$         400.00$                             

SUBTOTAL 400.00$                             

7 F7 CUSTOMTEACHERDESK

Teacher Station
*Worksurface - L-Shape
*Box/Box/File Pedestal
*Privacy Screen
*Overhead Cabinet with Steel Door
*Metal Bookcase

1 3,165.00$      3,165.00$                         

Subtotal 3,165.00$                         

8 B3 2021G-25

Porcelain Steel White Markerboard
*(4' x 6')
*Aluminum Trim
*Tackable Map Rail - Top
*Full Length Marker Tray with End Caps

4 550.00$         2,200.00$                         

SUBTOTAL 2,200.00$                         

9 B4 302AH
Natural Cork Tackboard with Aluminum Trim
*(48" x 96")
*Natural Add - Cork

2 340.00$         680.00$                             

SUBTOTAL 680.00$                             

SUBTOTAL 43,380.00$                



Administration Office Furniture
Line # Tag Item# Description Qty Price Ext. Price

1 F17 H105896L-CC

Single Full Pedestal Desk, LEFT
*(36" x 72")
*Box/Box/File Pedestal
*Laminate: Harvest

1 1,000.00$      1,000.00$                         

2 F17 H105903R-CC

Single Full Pedestal Credenza, RIGHT
*(24" x 72")
*File/File Pedestal
*Laminate: Harvest

1 900.00$         900.00$                             

3 F17 H105895R-CC

Single Full Pedestal Desk, RIGHT
*(36" x 72")
*Box/Box/File Pedestal
*Laminate: Harvest

1 1,000.00$      1,000.00$                         

4 F17 H105904L-CC

Single Full Pedestal Credenza, LEFT
*(24" x 72")
*File/File Pedestal
*Laminate: Harvest

1 900.00$         900.00$                             

5 F17 H10570-CC
Bridge for U-Shape Desk
*(47"W x 24"D)
*Laminate: Harvest

2 270.00$         540.00$                             

6 F17 H105383G-CC
Three Doors Frosted Wall Mount Storage
*(48"W)
*Laminate: Harvest

4 1,100.00$      4,400.00$                         

7 F17 HLSL78TW-A
Tackboard - 78"W
*Fits Under Wall Mount Storage
*Grade A Fabric: TBD

2 300.00$         600.00$                             

8 F17 H105532
2-Shelf Bookcase
*(36"W x 30"Ht)
*Laminate: Harvest

2 350.00$         700.00$                             

9 F23 KISN86MB

Signia Office Task Chair with Arms
*Mesh Back
*Palls P0 Fabric Seat: TBD
*Synchrotilt
*Black Plastic Base

2 560.00$         1,120.00$                         

10 F12 DN3B00
Doni Sled Base Armless Guest Chairs
*Two-Tone
*Upholstered Seat: TBD

6 360.00$         2,160.00$                         

11 F8 MSP

Maestro Stack Chairs
*Sled Base
*Poly Shell: TBD
*Frame Color: TBD

8 120.00$         960.00$                             

12 F82 PR3FX-74P

Portico 36" Round Table
*LX Base
*Laminate Top: TBD
*Base Color: TBD

2 600.00$         1,200.00$                         

13 B5 302AG
Tackboard (4' x 6')
*Natural ADD - Cork
*Aluminum Frame

2 240.00$         480.00$                             

Subtotal 15,960.00$                       

Grand Total: 322,171.00$                 

KI Sourcewell Contract #091423

Pricing Includes Shipping, Inside Delivery and Set-Up

Quote Pricing valid for 90 days from Date of Quote

Quoted by Fred Ernest, Vice President



COLLIERVILLE SCHOOLS

Painting Project at Bailey Station Elem and Collierville High School (per Specifications)
BID #FY24012

VENDOR Alvarez Bros.
Professional

Painters Savage Brothers X-Pert Painting
Matthews

Contract Painting AMG Painting Local Building Co
Terms: 30 30 30 30 30 30
Delivery: Days A.R.O. 52 Days 7/19/2024 7 weeks 7/19/2024

1 Bailey Station Elem 145,000.00 59,900.00 302,303.22 102,280.00 No Bid 96,000.00 168,040.00

Project Completion Date 7/30/2024 6/28/2024 7/18/2024 7/19/2024 7/19/2024 7/19/2024

2 Collierville High School 18,000.00 65,000.00 19,287.73 20,000.00 139,000.00 No Bid 30,706.00

Project Completion Date 7/19/2024 7/15/2024 7/18/2024 7/19/2024 7/19/2024 7/19/2024

Bond Cost Per $1,000 17.00 20.00 25.00 30.00 25.00 21.00 55.00

Contractor License Number 77273 48710 15748 44656 29407 72644 74377

Class BC-A/r BC-11, S-C BC-11, BC-3 BC-11 BC-11, BC-2, BC-3
BC-11,BC-14,BC-2,

BC-3 BC-A, BC-b (sm)
Exp Date 12/31/2023 6/30/2022 1/31/2024-Grace 10/31/2025 7/31/2025 6/30/2024 1/31/2026
Limit 80,000.00 200,000.00 3,000,000.00 400,000.00 1,000,000.00 140,000.00 1,300,000.00

Total if Awarded items 1 and 2 162,000.00 124,900.00 321,590.95 122,280.00 198,746.00

VENDOR Barnes & Brower Ditto Coatings
Grinder Taber &

Grinder
Wagner General

Contractors
Sterling Building

Specialists Fifer & Asssociates A & B Const. Co.
Terms: 30 30 30 30 60 30
Delivery: Days A.R.O. As Specified 50 52 53 14 Per Bid

1 Bailey Station Elem 100,349.00 97,930.00 197,613.19 133,479.00 135,795.70 588,900.00 104,914.00

Project Completion Date 7/19/2024 7/19/2024 7/19/2024 53 Days from NTP 7/19/2024 7/16/2024 7/19/2024

2 Collierville High School 23,519.00 No Bid 186,984.70 49,246.00 No Bid 56,900.00 24,700.00

Project Completion Date 7/19/2024 7/19/2024 53 Days from NTP 7/17/2024 7/19/2024

Bond Cost Per $1,000 11.95 $2,938.00 9.00 10.00 50.00 12.00 25.00

Contractor License Number 52754 69458 10555 47587 63933 46462 37516

Class BC, HRA, MU BC-11 BC-8, BC-C, MU-8

BC-A,BC-B,HRA-
A,HRA-C,HRA-E2,

MU BC-8 BC-A, BC-B, LMC BC, HRA, MU
Exp Date 7/31/2025 1/31/2026 4/30/2025 7/31/2025 9/30/2024 11/30/2024 2/28/2026
Limit Unlimited 1,000,000.00 Unlimited Unlimited 350,000.00 Unlimited Unlimited

Total if Awarded items 1 and 2 123,868.00 384,597.89 182,725.00 645,800.00 129,614.00
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