
This meeting is a meeting of the Board of Education in public for the purpose of conducting the School District’s business and is not to be 
considered a public community meeting.  There is a time for public participation during the meeting as indicated on the Agenda.

PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BOARD OF EDUCATION

REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING
PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS' ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, CONF. RM. #1, 8107 MUSTANG DRIVE, 

PORTAGE, MI 49002
FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 PM

AGENDA
VISION STATEMENT

An exceptional, continuously improving learning culture with high expectations, committed to all!

MISSION STATEMENT
Portage Public Schools will educate all students to achieve their potential.

I. CALL TO ORDER AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
II. REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA
III. REPORTS

1. SUPERINTENDENT'S REPORT
a. BOND PROJECT UPDATE
b. FINANCIAL REPORT

IV. COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS
1. BY CITIZENS
2. BY BOARD TRUSTEES
3. BOARD COMMITTEE REPORTS

V. CONSENT AGENDA
1. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

a. JANUARY 21, 2019 REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING MINUTES
b. FEBRUARY 11, 2019 POLICY GOVERNANCE RETREAT & COMMITTEE OF THE 
WHOLE WORK SESSION MEETING MINUTES

2. RECOMMENDATION FOR BUS PURCHASE
3. RECOMMENDATION FOR BOARD MEMBER ATTENDANCE
4. RECOMMENDATION - PURCHASE NMS THEATRICAL SOUND PKG
5. RECOMMENDATION - PURCHASE NMS THEATRICAL LIGHTING PKG

VI. REQUIRED ACTION ITEMS
1. MASB BOARD OF DIRECTORS ELECTION-REGION 6 & GROUP V (REQUIRED BY 
MASB)

VII. ACTION ITEMS
1. RECOMMENDATION FOR PCEC / WMS CONTRACTS (OP 6320)
2. APPROVAL OF GENERAL FUND BUDGET APPROPRIATIONS RESOLUTION 
2018/19 AMENDED BUDGET #1 (OP 6231)
3. RECOMMENDATION FOR CHROMEBOOK PURCHASE (OP 6320)
4. NATIONAL SCHOOL BREAKFAST WEEK PROCLAMATION

VIII. DISCUSSION ITEM
1. RECOMMENDATION FOR NHS SPANISH CLUB TRIP TO PERU IN 2020 (OP 2340)
2. RECOMMENDATION FOR NMS DEMOLITION CONTRACTOR (OP 6320)
3. RECOMMENDATION FOR NORTHERN NATATORIUM (OP 6320)

IX. ADJOURN
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

II. Revisions/Approval of Agenda 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the Board 

of Education approve the Agenda as printed (or as amended). 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

III. Reports 

1. Superintendent’s Report 

 a. Bond Project Update 

 

  

 

 

 

 b. Financial Report 
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Budget Actual %

Revenues 94,138,442$   42,933,721$     45.61% (1)

Expenditures 94,568,714     45,380,578       47.99% (2)

Transfers from Site Based Fund Balance 168,367          -                    -                 (3)

Excess (Deficit) of Revenues over Expenditures (261,905)$      (2,446,857)$     

Comparison 2016 - 17 2017 - 18

Revenues 47.19% 48.84%
  

Expenditures 47.88% 49.49%

Note 2 - Actual expenditures for 2018-19 are tracking closely to the previous year
      

    There are also some revenue timing differences for funds received.

Note 3 - Actual expenditures for the site based fund balance are included in the expenditure line items. 

Portage Public Schools
General Fund

Condensed Statement of Revenues and Expenditures
For the Seven Months Ended January 31, 2019

Note 1 - Actual revenues for 2018-19 are tracking less to the revenues received in 2017-18.
    This is due to prior year funding MPSERS 147c(2) that is not in the current year for $1,030,000.
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

IV. Comments or Communications 

1. By Citizens 

 

 

 

 

2. By Board Trustees 

 

 

 

 

3. Board Committee Reports 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

V. Consent Agenda 

1. Approval of Minutes 

 a. January 21, 2019 Regular Business Meeting Minutes 

 b. February 11, 2019 Policy Governance Retreat & Committee of the Whole Work 

Session 

 

 

2. Recommendation for Bus Purchase 

 That the Board of Education approve the purchase of five (5) 77-passenger buses and two 

(2) lift buses from Holland Bus for a total of  $668,768.00, the funds for which will come 

from the 2016 Bond Construction Fund bus purchase allocation. 

 

 

4. Recommendation for Board Member Attendance 

That the Board of Education approve the attendance of Randy Van Antwerp at the 

Govern for Impact Conference, June 20-22, 2019 in Quebec City, Canada and 

approve the attendance of Randy Van Antwerp, Terri Novari, and Joanne Willson at 

the Policy Governance® Boot Camp, April 25-26, 2019 in Grand Rapids, Michigan. 

    

 

 

5. Recommendation – Purchase NMS Theatrical Sound Pkg 

That the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical sound equipment from 

Parkway Electric & Communications LLC of Holland, MI in an amount not-to-exceed 

$33,007.99, proceeds coming from the 2016 Bond Construction Fund #1. 

 

 

 

6. Recommendation – Purchase NMS Theatrical Lighting Pkg 

That the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical lighting equipment from 

Pro Audio & Lighting of Warren, MI in an amount not-to-exceed $30,671.91, proceeds 

coming from the 2016 Bond Construction Fund #1. 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

January 21, 2019 

 

The Regular Business Meeting of the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools held on 

Monday, January 21, 2019, was called to order at 6:30 p.m. by President Van Antwerp in 

Conference Room 1 of the Administration Building, 8107 Mustang Drive.  Mr. Van Antwerp 

welcomed the audience and the Pledge of Allegiance was recited.  Following the Pledge there was a 

moment of silence in honor of Mike Westbrook, the District’s Transportation Director, who passed 

away. 

 

Board Trustees Present: Kurt Droppers, Terri Novaria, Rusty Rathburn, Bo Snyder, and Randy 

Van Antwerp 

 

Board Trustees Absent:  Celeste Shelton-Harris, Joanne Willson 

 

REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

Motion offered by Mr. Droppers, seconded by Mr. Rathburn, that the Board of Education 

approve the agenda as printed. 

 

The motion carried unanimously.   

 

REPORTS 

Superintendent’s Report 

Bond Project Update.  Superintendent Bielang shared the sad news that Mike Westbrook, the 

District Transportation Director, passed away this past weekend. Mr. Bielang paid tribute to Mr. 

Westbrook. “Mike was dedicated to his work.  He will be missed by so many. This is a big loss for 

the District.” 

 

Mr. Bielang announced January is Board Recognition Month in Michigan. Mr. Bielang thanked the 

Board for their dedication and service, and presented each Trustee with a certificate and token of 

appreciation. 

 

Mr. Ron Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations, shared a brief update on bond work 

progress.  Bid openings are complete for West Middle School and the Portage Community 

Education Center.  Details will be shared with the Board in February.  Mr. Herron added interior 

work continues on the other projects in progress. 

 

Change Order Summary / Bond Budget Update.  Mr. Dan Rathburn, OAK Project Manager, 

provided a financial update for bond work committed through Bond Change Order 16.  Mr. Dan 

Rathburn also detailed change order work by construction change directive for the Northern AEF, 

Central AEF, and Central Middle School.  Mr. Dan Rathburn added the Northern Natatorium bid 

opening is scheduled for February 5, 2019.  Questions from Trustees were addressed by Mr. Dan 

Rathburn. 

 

 

Enclosure V.1.a. 

February 25, 2019 
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Financial Report.  Ms. Paula Johnson, Director of Finance, reviewed the financial report for the 

six-month period ending December 31, 2018.  Ms. Johnson also commented on a recent conference 

she attended and activity in the Finance Office: budget amendment work and preparations for the 

February 13, 2019 count day.  Ms. Johnson addressed questions from Trustees. 

 

COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS 

President Van Antwerp opened the comments and communications portion of the meeting.  Vice 

President Novaria read the guidelines for public participation. 

 

Melissa Baker addressed Trustees regarding pool access concerns for the Portage Aquatics Club. 

 

Ryan O’Neill shared concerns regarding pool accessibility for the Portage Aquatics Club. 

 

Nick Christy expressed his concerns regarding pool accessibility for the Portage Aquatics Club. 

 

Stephanie Alkire shared her thoughts regarding the future of the Portage Aquatics Club and pool 

accessibility. 

 

Melissa Martinek addressed the Board relative to pool access for the Portage Aquatics Club. 

 

President Van Antwerp thanked the public participants for their comments and opened the floor to 

Trustee comments. 

 

Mr. Rathburn paid tribute to Mike Westbbrook and thanked the public participants for their 

comments. 

 

Mr. Snyder also paid tribute to Mike Westbrook, thanked the public participants for their comments, 

and complimented his fellow board members for their service.  

 

Mrs. Novaria encouraged Trustees to attend upcoming winter Arts events in the District. 

 

Mr. Van Antwerp thanked the public participants for their comments and expressed his confidence 

that Administration will find a viable solution to the concerns expressed.  Mr. Van Antwerp 

reminded Trustees of the January 23, 2019 Community Dialogue, the January 31, 2019 tour of 

Moorsbridge Elementary, and of the February 11, 2019 Policy Governance Retreat.   

 

Superintendent Bielang commented on the public participant concerns regarding pool access for the 

Portage Aquatics Club.  Mr. Bielang stated that discussions continue; no decision has been made on 

the matter. 

 

CONSENT AGENDA 

President Van Antwerp presented the following Consent Agenda items for approval by the 

Board of Education: approve meeting minutes from the December 10, 2018 Regular Business 

Meeting and the January 7, 2019 Organizational Meeting. 

 

There being no objection to the items, the motion carried unanimously. 
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ACTION ITEMS 

There were no action items on the agenda. 

 

DISCUSSION ITEMS 

Recommendation for NMS Furniture Purchase 

Mr. Ron Herron reviewed background information and the recommendation for the purchase of 

furniture for North Middle School.  Ms. Brittany Walker, designer from Stantec, detailed the process 

and steps involved.  Mr. Herron and Ms. Walker responded to Trustee questions. 

 

Board Member Attendance at Upcoming Events 

Mr. Van Antwerp shared information on upcoming events for board members, and asked Trustees to 

contact him or Mr. Bielang if they were interested in attending. 

 

2019-20 Board Meeting Schedule 

Mr. Van Antwerp asked Trustees to review the proposed 2019-20 board meeting schedule in 

preparation for Board action in February. 

 

With no further business to come before the Board, the meeting was adjourned at 7:30 p.m. 

 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

Barb Atkinson 

Recording Secretary 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

POLICY GOVERNANCE RETREAT AND  

COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE WORK SESSION 

February 11, 2019 

 

POLICY GOVERNANCE RETREAT 

The Policy Governance Retreat of the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools held on 

Monday, February 11, 2019, was called to order at 4:00 p.m. by President Van Antwerp in the 

Superintendent’s Conference Room of the Administration Building, 8107 Mustang Drive. 

  

Board Trustees Present: Kurt Droppers, Terri Novaria, Rusty Rathburn, Celeste Shelton-Harris, 

Bo Snyder, Randy Van Antwerp, and Joanne Willson 

 

Board Trustees Absent:  None 

 

Administration Present: Mark Bielang, Superintendent; Michael Pascoe, Assistant 

Superintendent of Instruction and Assessment, and Mike Huber, 

Director of Curriculum 

 

Others Present: Gary Goscenski of Perspectives Consulting 

 

REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

Motion offered by Mrs. Willson, seconded by Mr. Droppers, that the Board of Education 

approve the agenda as printed. 

 

The motion carried unanimously.   

 

Mr. Goscenski facilitated Board discussion, which covered Monitoring Report 1.1, Board Self-

Assessment Form, Owner Linkage Committee meeting follow-up, middle school enrollment task 

force update, and a Policy Committee update regarding board member succession. 

 

The Policy Governance Retreat adjourned at 6:20 p.m. 

 

COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE WORK SESSION 

The Committee of the Whole Work Session of the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools 

held on Monday, February 11, 2019, was called to order at 6:30 p.m. by President Van Antwerp in 

Conference Room 1 of the Administration Building, 8107 Mustang Drive.  Mr. Van Antwerp 

welcomed the audience and the Pledge of Allegiance was recited.   

 

Board Trustees Present: Kurt Droppers, Terri Novaria, Rusty Rathburn, Celeste Shelton-Harris, 

Bo Snyder, Randy Van Antwerp, and Joanne Willson 

 

Board Trustees Absent:  None 

 

Enclosure V.1.b. 

February 25, 2019 

11



 

 

REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

Motion offered by Mr. Droppers, seconded by Mrs. Novaria, that the Board of Education 

approve the agenda as amended to remove from the agenda the CommuniTEEN update. 

 

The motion carried unanimously.   

 

REPORTS 

Superintendent’s Report 

Bond Project Update.  Superintendent Bielang shared introductory comments.  Ms. Amy Franks, 

Central Middle School Industrial Technology Teacher introduced three students who presented a 

report, which focused on engineering.  The students visited the Central Middle School construction 

site and learned about scientific principles, load-bearing walls, project schedules, and moving heavy 

loads with a crane.  The students shared how they connected the engineering knowledge they 

achieved from their visit with their bridge building project.  The students addressed questions from 

the Board.  Superintendent Bielang and Trustees thanked Ms. Franks and the students for their 

presentation. 

 

Mr. Bielang reminded Trustees and the audience of the Community Dialogue scheduled for February 

12 at 6:30 p.m. in the Northern High School Commons.   

 

Per Mr. Bielang, we have used eight snow days to date.  Districts are allotted six by the state each 

year but can appeal to the State Board to excuse three additional days.  At this time, legislators are 

discussing how they might help but no decision has been made.   

 

Superintendent Bielang gave a “shout out” to Central High students for their performance of Big 

Fish.  The students were limited in their rehearsal time due to snow days.  Even so, they put on a 

great performance. 

 

COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS 

President Van Antwerp opened the comments and communications portion of the meeting.  Dr. 

Shelton-Harris read the guidelines for public participation. 

 

Melissa Kann addressed the Board regarding pool scheduling for the Portage Aquatic Club (PAC). 

 

Denise DeVries shared comments regarding pool time for the Portage Aquatic Club. 

 

Superintendent Bielang provided a pool scheduling update.  Administration is working hard to 

review and revise the pool schedule.  Some of the schedule is driven by the construction schedule.  

We will only have one available pool. We are looking at high school and middle school usage for 

both practices and competitions and PAC usage to find a schedule that works for all.  We are even 

looking at lane availability, not just pool availability.  Mr. Bielang added we are getting close to 

putting together a tentative schedule and plan to make that available on or about March 1. 

 

President Van Antwerp thanked the citizens and Mr. Bielang for their remarks and opened the floor 

to Trustee comments. 
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Mrs. Novaria paid tribute to Central High students for their performance of Big Fish.  Mrs. Novaria 

also encouraged Trustees to attend tomorrow’s Community Dialogue. 

 

Mrs. Willson expressed her thanks to Michelle Karpinski for communications on events and updated 

schedules, and thanked the Maintenance Department for their work in keeping our students and staff 

safe with the challenges winter brings. 

 

Mr. Rathburn thanked Mr. Bielang and Administration for assisting with venue/arrangements for 

Mike Westbrook’s service. 

 

Mr. Van Antwerp reminded Trustees of the Board tour of 12th Street Elementary on February 21 at 

9:00 a.m.  Mr. Van Antwerp added the Centennial Committee met for the first time last week; 

planning is underway for this event! 

 

CONSENT AGENDA 

President Van Antwerp presented the following Consent Agenda items for approval by the 

Board of Education: that the Board of Education approve the purchase of furniture as 

presented for North Middle School totaling $829,274.33, the funds for which will come from 

the 2016 Bond Fund #1 – Furniture, Fixtures, and Equipment Budget; and that the Board of 

Education approve the Board meeting schedule for the 2019-20 school year (July 22, 2019 

through June 22, 2020) as presented with all meetings to be held at the Administration 

Building beginning at 6:30 p.m. 

 

There being no objection to the items, the motion carried unanimously. 

 

DISCUSSION ITEMS 

Recommendation for PCEC/WMS Contracts 

Mr. Ron Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations, detailed background information and the 

recommendation for Bid Pack 4A - bond work construction to take place at the Community 

Education Center and West Middle School.  Mr. Dan Rathburn of OAK detailed the bid summary 

sheets by building and building and bid category.  

  

In addition, for reference purposes, Mr. Dan Rathburn shared a financial update for work committed 

through Change Order 16. 

 

Mr. Herron and Mr. Dan Rathburn addressed questions from Trustees. 

 

2018-19 Budget Amendment 

Ms. Paula Johnson, Director of Finance, reviewed highlights of the General Fund Budget 

Amendment #1. 

 

Recommendation for Bus Purchase 

Mr. Ron Herron reviewed background information and the recommendation to purchase buses and 

responded to questions from the Board. 
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Recommendation for Board Member Attendance 

Mr. Van Antwerp briefly reviewed the recommendation for board members to attend upcoming 

events. 

 

MASB Board of Directors (Group V) Election 

Relative to the MASB Board of Directors election, Mr. Van Antwerp asked Trustees to review the 

candidate bios included in the agenda packet in preparation to take action at their February 25, 2019 

meeting. 

 

Recommendation – Purchase NMS Theatrical Sound Package 

Mr. Dan Vomastek, Director of Information Systems & Assessment, reviewed the background 

formation and the recommendation. 

 

Recommendation – Purchase NMS Theatrical Lighting Package 

Mr. Dan Vomastek, Director of Information Systems & Assessment, reviewed background 

information and the recommendation. 

 

ACTION ITEMS 

Acceptance of Monitoring Report 1.4 

Motion offered by Mrs. Willson, seconded by Dr. Shelton-Harris, that the Board of Education 

accept as presented the Monitoring Report on 1.4, Ends Policy, as a reasonable interpretation 

and evidence of compliance with policy. 

 

Mr. Bielang shared highlights of his report. 

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

Acceptance of Monitoring Report 2.4 

Motion offered by Mr. Snyder, seconded by Mrs. Novaria, that the Board of Education accept 

as presented the Monitoring Report on 2.4, Executive Limitation Policy 2.4, as a reasonable 

interpretation and evidence of compliance with policy. 

 

Mr. Bielang commented this report has been updated since the last report on 2.4 to reflect this year’s 

figures. 

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

With no further business to come before the Board, the meeting was adjourned at 8:03 p.m. 

 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

Barb Atkinson 

Recording Secretary 

14



 

 
 

 

TO:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent  

FROM:  Ron Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations 

CC:  Paula Johnson, Director of Finance 

DATE:  January 18, 2019 

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Bus Purchase 

Recommendation 

That the Board of Education approve the purchase of five (5) 77-passenger buses and two (2) 

lift buses from Holland Bus for a total of $668,768.00.  This purchase would come from the 

2016 Bond Construction Fund bus purchase allocation.    

 

Background Information 

Our regular replacement schedule calls for six (6) busses to be replaced annually. In 

evaluating our current lifts, we have a few that are starting to have increased repairs and we 

will be decommissioning these in the next few years.  Because of this and the increase in 

transportation demand levels, we are requesting one (1) additional lift bus.  We believe this 

will assist us in avoiding major repairs to buses that we would be keeping for only a short time 

before replacement. This rotation and replacement would be done in our normal process of 

evaluating our oldest and/or highest mileage buses, which are beyond their life expectancy.  

 

The increase cost of these buses are due to the additional safety features that we are adding, as 

well as the changes that were made to the specifications of the buses.  These new buses will 

have additional back stop signs, reverse cameras, stability control and air disk brakes to make 

our drivers and students safer.   In the last couple of purchases, we bid “stock” buses, but these 

buses will have to be built. 

 

The attached bid summary provides pertinent results for your review.

Enclosure V.2. 
February 25, 2019 
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Bid Responses  

Options 

       Warranty Information- 

Full warranties are separate from 
Engine\Trans. 

Vendor Year 
Delivery 

Date 
Reg. Bus 

(5) 

 

Lift Bus 
(2) 

Chassis/ 

Body 

Engine\ 

Transmission 2 Yr 3 Yr 
5 

Yr\100.00 

Engine\Trans. 

5 Yr 

Holland 
Bus- 

Diesel 2020 
90-110 
Days $466,440 

 

Bluebird 

220 HP 
Diesel\ Allison 

2500   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus- Gas 2020 

80-110 
Days $451,440 

 
Bluebird 

Ford 6.8L\ 
Ford 6R140   X 

Standard- 
Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus – 

Gas Lift 2020 
80-110 
Days  

$217,328 

Bluebird 
Ford 6.8L\ 

Ford 6R140   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus – 
Diesel- 

Lift 2020 
90-110 
Days  

$223,328 

Bluebird 

220 HP 
Diesel\ Allison 

2500   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Hoekstra- 
Diesel 2020 

May 1, 

2019 $457,180 

 

Thomas 

220 HP 
Diesel\Allison 

2500  X  
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Hoekstra- 
Diesel 2020 

June 1, 
2019  

$215,776 

Thomas 

220 HP 
Diesel\Allison 

2500  X  
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

 

In the Warranty Information listed above, “Full Warranty” is basically the whole bus with the 

exception of wear parts. Different components on a bus have different warranties (seats, cross 

members, paint, are examples) and can vary up to a 7 years depending on the vendor. 

 

International did not submit bids for buses. 

 

We have purchased buses from Holland Bus for several years now and have been very 

satisfied with prompt support of any issues that we have had. We purchased gas buses on the 

past couple of purchases and have been very happy with their performance and cost savings 

overall. 

 

We would be happy to answer any questions that Board members have related to this 

recommendation. 
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Mark T. Bielang 

Superintendent 
Phone: 269.323.5147 

fax: 269.323.5149 

mbielang@portageps.org 

 

TO:  Board of Education 

FROM:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent 

DATE:  February 6, 2019 

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Board Member Attendance 

Recommendation 

That the Board of Education approve the attendance of Randy Van Antwerp at the Govern for 

Impact Conference, June 20-22, 2019 in Quebec City, Canada and approve the attendance of 

Randy Van Antwerp, Terri Novari, and Joanne Willson at the Policy Governance® Boot Camp, 

April 25-26, 2019 in Grand Rapids, Michigan.     
 

Background Information 

The Govern for Impact Conference (formerly known as the IPGA Annual Conference) is for 

Boards, CEOs and Administrators that use the Policy Governance® System.  These conferences 

provide rich discussion, networking and engaging workshops.   Mr. Van Antwerp has attended 

this event in past years and would like to attend again this year. 

 

The Policy Governance Boot Camp is a two-day event focused on Policy Governance® theory 

and understanding.  This event also promises to be rich in discussion, networking and engaging 

sessions.  

 

Board action to approve attendance as noted above is recommended. 

Enclosure V.3. 

February 25, 2019 
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Information and Technology Systems 
8107 Mustang Drive, Portage, MI  49002 

(269) 323-5100 -- help@portageps.org 

MEMO 
 

  To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
  Fr: Daniel J. Vomastek, Director 
  Dt: February 6, 2019 
  Re: Recommendation to Purchase North Middle School Theatrical Sound Package

 
 

RECOMMENDATION 

I recommend the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical sound equipment from Parkway 
Electric & Communications LLC of Holland, MI in an amount not to exceed $33,007.99, proceeds coming from 
the 2016 Bond Construction Fund #1. 
 
BACKGROUND 

Each of our new middle schools will be equipped with a ‘black box’ performance theater.  This 
recommendation is for the purchase of the flexible sound system required for the North Middle’s ‘black box’ 
space.  
 

AWARD AND FINANCIAL DETAILS 

This is a relatively straightforward purchase.  Parkway was the overall low and thus selected.  After careful 
analysis of the bid and the available budget, we have chosen to eliminate and reduce the quantities of some of 
the items requested in the RFP.   The total cost for this equipment aligns with our expectations. 
 
I have attached the bid summary, and I would be happy to answer any questions you or the Board may have. 
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Portage Public Schools

 #10667 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Sound Package
December 21, 2018 -- 1:30 pm

Vendor Name Pro Audio & Lighting Parkway Electric & Communications LLC PROVIDEO
Address 2400 E 14 Mile Road, Warren, MI 48092 11952 James St., Holland, MI 49424 26471 Southpoiont Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551

Contact Name Robert Kuron Brian Rotman Lara Kuhlman
Contact E Mail robk@proaal.com brian.rotman@parkwayelectric.com lara@provideosystems.com

Familial X X X
Iran Econ Act X X X

Legal Status Form X X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

1 Allen & Heath SQ5 w/Dante Card $3,101.06 $3,101.06 $3,031.33 $3,031.33 $3,727.00 $3,727.00

1 Allen & Heath AB168 $887.38 $887.38 $857.00 $857.00 $876.00 $876.00

1 Allen & Heath AR84 $635.14 $635.14 $620.86 $620.86 $634.00 $634.00

8 Electro-Voice Fri-2082 $639.83 $5,118.64 $630.68 $5,045.44 $678.00 $5,424.00

1 Electro-Voice EVF-1181S $1,113.49 $1,113.49 $1,097.71 $1,097.71 $1,180.00 $1,180.00

2 Electro-Voice EKX-12P $581.82 $1,163.64 $587.98 $1,175.96 $632.00 $1,264.00

1 QSC CXD8.4Q $3,161.00 $3,161.00 $3,118.28 $3,118.28 $2,799.00 $2,799.00

1 QSC CXD4.3Q $2,180.00 $2,180.00 $2,150.54 $2,150.54 $1,427.00 $1,427.00

1 QSC QSys Core 110f $2,180.00 $2,180.00 $2,150.54 $2,150.54 $1,976.00 $1,976.00

1 QSC Qsys UCI License $109.00 $109.00 $107.53 $107.53 $110.00 $110.00

1 QSC Qsys Scripting License $218.00 $218.00 $215.05 $215.05 $219.00 $219.00

1 AtteroTech Zone Controller (Axon C1) $399.20 $399.20 $321.51 $321.51 $328.00 $328.00

4 Shure SM58-LC $88.00 $352.00 $86.02 $344.08 $88.00 $352.00

4 Shure SM57-LC $80.30 $321.20 $78.49 $313.96 $80.00 $320.00

4 K&M #210/2 $63.25 $253.00 $50.81 $203.24 $58.00 $232.00

4 K&M #259 $60.50 $242.00 $53.23 $212.92 $60.00 $240.00

2 Whirlwind IMP2 $41.83 $83.66 $42.53 $85.06 $42.00 $84.00

1 Whirlwind Director 2 $98.11 $98.11 $99.74 $99.74 $98.00 $98.00

1 Whirlwind pod DI $61.28 $61.28 $62.30 $62.30 $44.00 $44.00

20 ProCo MasterMike 25’ $24.61 $492.20 $18.76 $375.20 $56.00 $1,120.00

2 ProCo BPMBMB-10 $21.99 $43.98 $9.16 $18.32 $20.00 $40.00

10 ProCo 25-SPK14/2 $22.68 $226.80 $25.13 $251.30 $41.00 $410.00

4 ProCo EG15 $8.84 $35.36 $6.58 $26.32 $11.00 $44.00

2 ProCo C270201-25F $34.09 $68.18 $34.57 $69.14 $33.00 $66.00

1 Tascam SS-CDR200 $903.10 $903.10 $882.80 $882.80 $672.00 $672.00

1 Shure ULXD4Q $4,378.00 $4,378.00 $4,065.59 $4,065.59 $4,369.00 $4,369.00

1 Shure UA8-470-530 $23.10 $23.10 $21.45 $21.45 $23.00 $23.00

4 Shure ULXD1 Bodypack $385.00 $1,540.00 $357.53 $1,430.12 $384.00 $1,536.00

2 Shure ULXD2/B87A $550.00 $1,100.00 $510.75 $1,021.50 $549.00 $1,098.00

2 Shure MX153C/O-TQG $174.90 $349.80 $162.42 $324.84 $175.00 $350.00

2 Shure MX153T/O-TQG $174.90 $349.80 $162.42 $324.84 $175.00 $350.00

0 AKG C1000 $157.08 $0.00 $153.55 $0.00 $157.00 $0.00

0 AKG C3000 $214.83 $0.00 $213.87 $0.00 $218.00 $0.00

0 Shure Beta52a $148.50 $0.00 $137.90 $0.00 $149.00 $0.00

2 Shure SM81 $325.60 $651.20 $302.37 $604.74 $325.00 $650.00

1 EV PC-18/XLR $190.43 $190.43 $187.55 $187.55 $202.00 $202.00

2 Shure WL184 $96.80 $193.60 $89.89 $179.78 $97.00 $194.00

2 Shure WA302 $13.20 $26.40 $12.26 $24.52 $13.00 $26.00

2 K&M 25900 - Black $71.50 $143.00 $62.90 $125.80 $71.00 $142.00

4 On-Stage Stands MS7201B $13.28 $53.12 $14.17 $56.68 $18.00 $72.00

2 Behringer Eurolive B205D $156.80 $313.60 $150.53 $301.06 $154.00 $308.00

0 Drum Shield DS4 L - 5 Section acrylic drum panel with flexible hinges $234.00 $0.00 $224.73 $0.00 $330.00 $0.00

0 Clearsonic C5 bag $160.93 $0.00 $144.62 $0.00 $151.00 $0.00

1 Eartec HUB7SMXS $1,685.00 $1,685.00 $1,503.39 $1,503.39 $1,525.00 $1,525.00
1 Freight $317.20 $317.20 $0.00 $0.00 $750.00 $750.00

Calculated Total $34,761.67 $33,007.99 $35,281.00

Signatures

19



 
 
 

Information and Technology Systems 
8107 Mustang Drive, Portage, MI  49002 

(269) 323-5100 -- help@portageps.org 

MEMO 
 

  To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
  Fr: Daniel J. Vomastek, Director 
  Dt: February 6, 2019 
  Re: Recommendation to Purchase North Middle School Theatrical Lighting Package

 
 

RECOMMENDATION 

I recommend the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical sound equipment from Pro Audio & 
Lighting of Warren, MI in an amount not to exceed $30,671.91, proceeds coming from the 2016 Bond 
Construction Fund #1. 
 
BACKGROUND 

Each of our new middle schools will be equipped with a ‘black box’ performance theater.  This 
recommendation is for the purchase of the theatrical lighting fixtures for events for the North Middle’s ‘black 
box’ space.  
 

AWARD AND FINANCIAL DETAILS 

This is a relatively straightforward purchase.  Pro Audio & Video was the lowest complete bid.  After careful 
analysis of the bid and the available budget, we have chosen to eliminate and reduce the quantities of some of 
the items requested in the RFP.   The total cost for this equipment was higher than anticipated due to 
increases in tariffs from LED manufacturing, however, we can comfortably reduce and eliminate certain 
quantities of equipment to commission this space.  In total, the reduction resulted in a cost savings 
approximating 60%. 
 
I have attached the bid summary, and I would be happy to answer any questions you or the Board may have. 
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Portage Public Schools

 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
December 21, 2018 -- 1:30 pm

Vendor Name Pro Audio & Lighting Vincent Lighting Systmes
Address 2400 E 14 Mile Road, Warren, MI 48092 6161 Cochran Road, Ste. D, Solon, OH 44139

Contact Name Robert Kuron John Conley
Contact E Mail robk@proaal.com jconley@vls.com

Familial X X
Iran Econ Act X X

Legal Status Form X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $445.29 $21,373.92 $475.56 $22,826.88

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $357.25 $1,429.00 $338.18 $1,352.72

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,149.12 $3,447.36 $1,363.65 $4,090.95

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,213.06 $0.00 $1,302.27 $0.00

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,541.74 $0.00 $1,829.54 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $8,567.21 $0.00 $7,704.54 $0.00

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $272.44 $544.88 $245.45 $490.90

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $682.34 $0.00 $613.63 $0.00

55 10’ DMX cable $6.56 $360.80 $7.89 $433.95

12 25’ DMX cable $9.94 $119.28 $14.71 $176.52

1 50’ DMX cable $18.69 $18.69 $27.21 $27.21

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $48.75 $195.00 $38.14 $152.56

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $16.25 $828.75 $28.36 $1,446.36

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $22.50 $540.00 $24.20 $580.80

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $45.74 $182.96 $39.06 $156.24

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $65.00 $65.00 $59.45 $59.45

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $105.99 $105.99 $110.61 $110.61

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $22.81 $68.43 $21.81 $65.43

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $8.70 $469.80 $8.53 $460.62

55 Safety Cables $2.75 $151.25 $2.00 $110.00

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $109.93 $439.72 $68.18 $272.72

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $4.98 $19.92 $0.00 $0.00

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $6.54 $26.16 $6.00 $24.00
1 Freight $285.00 $285.00

Calculated Total $30,671.91 $32,837.92
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 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
Vendor Name John S. Hyatt & Associates Inc PROVIDEO

Address 1765 Alpine Ave NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49504 26471 Southpoint Rd., Perrysburg, OH 43551
Contact Name Jessi Nix Lara Kuhlman
Contact E Mail jessin@jshaa.com lara@provideosystems.com

Familial X X
Iran Econ Act X X

Legal Status Form X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $460.35 $22,096.80 $508.00 $24,384.00

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $345.00 $1,380.00 $415.00 $1,660.00

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,320.00 $3,960.00 $1,310.00 $3,930.00

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,383.00 $0.00 $1,306.00 $0.00

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,771.00 $0.00 $1,758.00 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $7,828.00 $0.00 $9,180.00 $0.00

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $293.00 $586.00 $288.00 $576.00

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $594.00 $0.00 $784.00 $0.00

55 10’ DMX cable $10.00 $550.00 $8.00 $440.00

12 25’ DMX cable $16.50 $198.00 $13.00 $156.00

1 50’ DMX cable $30.00 $30.00 $22.00 $22.00

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $45.00 $180.00 $39.00 $156.00

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $30.00 $1,530.00 $32.00 $1,632.00

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $41.00 $984.00 $39.00 $936.00

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $39.00 $156.00 $35.00 $140.00

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $60.00 $60.00 $53.00 $53.00

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $165.00 $165.00 $124.00 $124.00

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $27.00 $81.00 $26.00 $78.00

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $11.00 $594.00 $9.00 $486.00

55 Safety Cables $2.00 $110.00 $5.00 $275.00

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $70.00 $280.00 $87.00 $348.00

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $5.00 $20.00 $6.00 $24.00

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $6.50 $26.00 $8.00 $32.00
1 Freight $430.00 $430.00 $375.00 $375.00

Calculated Total $33,416.80 $35,827.00
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 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
Vendor Name SLS Production Services TPC Technologies, Inc. LED Lighting Wholesale Inc.

Address 1711 Vanderbilt Ave, Portage, MI 49002 185 Bell Rd., Niles, MI 49120 400 E. Cork St., Kalamazoo, mI 49001
Contact Name Brad Scott Marty Golob Cody O'Brien
Contact E Mail office@slsmi.com mgolob@tpctechnologies.com cody@ledlightingwholesaleinc.com

Familial X X X
Iran Econ Act X X X

Legal Status Form X X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $467.16 $22,423.68 $439.43 $21,092.64 $534.75 $25,668.00

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $388.85 $1,555.40 $439.52 $1,758.08 No Bid

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,205.55 $3,616.65 $1,260.00 $3,780.00 $1,380.00 $4,140.00

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,556.50 $0.00 $1,174.95 $0.00 No Bid

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,617.45 $0.00 $1,690.50 $0.00 $1,851.00 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $9,002.40 $0.00 $7,119.00 $0.00 No Bid

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $308.00 $616.00 $336.00 $672.00 No Bid

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $625.00 $0.00 $567.00 $0.00 No Bid

55 10’ DMX cable $20.97 $1,153.35 $27.51 $1,513.05 $8.75 $481.25

12 25’ DMX cable $32.30 $387.60 $34.91 $418.92 $14.18 $170.16

1 50’ DMX cable $49.41 $49.41 $48.67 $48.67 $25.00 $25.00

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $43.13 $172.52 $43.16 $172.64 No Bid

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $19.92 $1,015.92 $28.98 $1,477.98 No Bid

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $38.13 $915.12 $55.35 $1,328.40 No Bid

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $40.95 $163.80 $51.22 $204.88 No Bid

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $51.70 $51.70 $75.14 $75.14 No Bid

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $109.00 $109.00 $120.74 $120.74 No Bid

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $26.32 $78.96 $21.84 $65.52 No Bid

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $10.28 $555.12 $8.54 $461.16 No Bid

55 Safety Cables $4.11 $226.05 $6.49 $356.95 $3.15 $173.25

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $111.00 $444.00 $91.35 $365.40 No Bid

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $7.85 $31.40 $4.03 $16.12 No Bid

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $9.52 $38.08 $5.29 $21.16 No Bid
1 Freight $225.00 $225.00 $500.00 $500.00

Calculated Total $33,828.76 $34,449.45 $30,657.66
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VI. Required Actions Items 

 1. MASB Board of Directors Election (Required by MASB) 

  As indicated in the board packet materials, MASB active members are divided into regions 

designated according to their ISD (RESA) boundaries and then into groups based on pupil 

membership.  Portage Public Schools is in MASB Region 6 and Group V.  The Board may 

vote for one (1) candidate from Region 6 and one (1) candidate from Group V.  The 

candidate bios are included in the agenda packet.  The candidates are as follows: 

 

Region 6: Dorothy Dilsaver and Donald D. Myers 

Group V: Steve Hyer, Lisa M. Kreager, and Martin Ray 

 

 

 

  Recommended Motion – Region 6: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the 

Board of Education, cast its vote for candidate _____(state candidate name)________ 

to represent MASB Region 6. 

 

 

Recommended Motion – Group V: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the 

Board of Education, cast its vote for candidate _____(state candidate name)________ 

to represent MASB Group V. 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

1. Recommendation for PCEC / WMS Contracts (OP 6320) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the Board 

of Education authorize Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. to issue Notices of Pending Award, in the 

amounts indicated for the West Middle School and the Community Educational Center, to 

contractors and suppliers listed on the Bid Summary Sheets, pending confirmation that all 

requirements of the Contract Documents have been met.  Furthermore, that upon receipt by 

Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. of the appropriate documentation, contracts will be awarded to 

these contractors and suppliers by Portage Public Schools, as presented. 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

2. Approval of General Fund Budget Appropriations Resolution 2018/19 Amended 

 Budget #1 (OP 6231) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the Board 

of Education approve the Budget Amendment Resolution to the General Appropriations Act 

(General Fund) for the 2018/19 year, as presented. 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

3. Recommendation for Chromebook Purchase (OP 6320) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the Board 

of Education authorize the purchase of 700 Chromebooks from Sehi Computer Products of 

Rochester Hills, MI in an amount not-to-exceed $154,301.00, the proceeds for which will 

come from the 2016 Bond Fund #1, as presented. 
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Information and Technology Systems 

8107 Mustang Drive, Portage, MI  49002 
(269) 323-5100 -- help@portageps.org 

MEMO 
 

  To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
  Fr: Daniel J. Vomastek, Director 
  Dt: February 20th, 2019 
  Re: Student Chromebook Purchase 

 
 
RECOMMENDATION  
I recommend the Board of Education authorize the purchase of 700 Chromebooks from Sehi Computer 
Products of Rochester Hills Michigan in an amount not to exceed $154,301, proceeds coming from the 2016 
Bond Fund #1. 
 
BACKGROUND 

As a part of our 1-1 computing initiative, we are distributing a Chromebook to the majority of our 6-12 students. 
We typically do this in the fall with our 6th and 9th grade students.  This purchase will be distributed to our 8th 
grade students yet this year for a variety of reasons: 

● It will free up time on the technology team’s fall workload, allowing us to devote more attention to 
getting the new North Middle School and Central athletic fields up and running. 

● It will free up Chromebook carts so we can get a head start on completing the 2nd grade rollout. 
● It gets us ahead of potential tariff-related cost increases many vendors and manufacturers predict. 

 
AWARD INFORMATION 

As the Michigan purchase window is not currently open, we issued our own RFP.  As expected, we received 
nearly 20 proposals.  Sehi is the third lowest bid.  We selected Sehi over the two lower bids as follows: 

● The low bid came from Hypertech with a net difference of $12,012.  The unit they quoted was from a 
previous model year.  Given the length of time these Chromebooks will be in service we prefer to go 
with the most recent model. 

● The second low bid came from SAITECH, net difference of $553.  While SAITECH quoted the same 
Chromebook, they are not based in Michigan and we have not worked with them in the past.  We have 
worked with Sehi on numerous occasions, and have never had an issue with customer service or order 
fulfillment. 

 
At unit price of $220.43, the Sehi quote meets our set budget goal of $230 per unit, and includes all licenses as 
well as a 3 year warranty with pick up service. 
 
Finally, I would like to offer my thanks to the Board for considering this item for ‘fast-track’ approval. The chess 
pieces moved a little faster on the schedule than I had anticipated.  This action will be a huge help. 
 

I would be happy to answer any other questions you or the Board may have. 
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Portage Public Schools

#10669A - Fall 2019 Chromebook Purchase
Tuesday, February 19, 2019 @ 1:00 pm

Vendor Name CDW G
SDF Professional 
Computer Services Hypertec USA Inc DILTEX Inc SAITECH INC SEHI Computer Products

Address Vernon Hills, IL Greenville, NC Tempe, AZ West Covina, CA Fremont, CA Rochester Hills, MI
Contact Name Wes Farrell, Sr. Shiv Ajmera Mike Marracino Dil Singh Shalini Kalra Craig Sehi

Contact E Mail wesfar@cdw.com
sajmera@sdf-sai.

com
bidsus@hypertec.

com
dil.singh@diltexinc.

com govtsales@esaitech.com craig@sehi.com
Familial YES YES YES YES YES YES

Iran Econ Act YES YES YES YES YES NO
Legal Status Form YES YES YES YES YES NO

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Make/Model
Acer Chromebook 

C771-C4TM
HP Chromebook 

11 G6
HP Chromebook 

11 G5 HP UQ990E 
HP Chromebook 16GB 

P/N 3NV57UT#ABA

HP Chromebook 
11 GS EE 

(Purchased before 
March 29,2019)

Unit Cost Per Chromebook $264.00 $199.95 $179.28 $206.73 $219.64 $220.43

Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License $24.00 $23.00 $23.99 $22.95 $0.00

$37.00 $49.00

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses $227,500.00 $190,365.00 $142,289.00 $160,776.00 $153,748.00 $154,301.00
Stated Total $227,500.00 $190,365.00 $142,289.00 $160,776.00 $153,748.00 $154,301.00
ALTERNATE # 1

Make/Model
HP Chromebook 32 GB 

P/N 3NV58UT#ABA

HP Chromebook 
11 GS EE 

(Purchased after 
March 29,2019)

Unit Cost Per Chromebook $244.69 $233.17

Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $171,283.00 $163,219.00
Stated Total $171,283.00 $163,219.00
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Portage Public Schools

#10669A - Fall 2019 Chromebook Purchase
Tuesday, February 19, 2019 @ 1:00 pm

Vendor Name
Address

Contact Name

Contact E Mail
Familial

Iran Econ Act
Legal Status Form

Make/Model

Unit Cost Per Chromebook
Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses
Stated Total
ALTERNATE # 1

Make/Model

Unit Cost Per Chromebook
Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses
Stated Total

OCEAN Inc. AKA Comp Solutions IncNew Tech Solutions Inc Firefly Computers Virtucom Inc Trinity 3 Technology 
Grand Rapids, MI Chicago, IL Freemont, CA Norcross, GA St. Paul, MN
Nadeem Hamid Fahad Rafique Anita Vasantrai Marissa Kolmer Sean Beck Jonathon Worre

nadeemhamid@oc
eaninc.com

fahad@akacomp.
com anita@ntsca.com mkolmer@fireflycomputers.com

sbeck@virtucom.
com

jworre@trinity3.
com

YES YES NO YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Lenovo 100e

HP Smartbuy 
Chromebook 11A 

G6 Lenovo TS 100e
HP Chromebook 11 G6 EE w/ 3 

Yr Warranty
HP Chromebook 

11 G6 EE

Lenovo 100E 
N3350 w/ "Platinum 
Warranty"

$216.84 $263.97 $214.00 $210.00 $226.80 $269.00

$23.20 $24.31 $25.00 $24.85 $24.00
$29.85 $29.00

$188,923.00 $201,796.00 $187,600.00 $164,395.00 $175,560.00 $188,300.00
$188,923.00 $201,796.00 $187,600.00 $164,395.00 $175,560.00 $188,300.00

Lenovo 100e Chrombook w/ 3 
Yr Warranty

Lenovo 100E 
N3350 w/ "Gold 
Warranty"

$213.00 $249.00

$24.85

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $166,495.00 $0.00 $174,300.00
$166,495.00 $174,300.00
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Portage Public Schools

#10669A - Fall 2019 Chromebook Purchase
Tuesday, February 19, 2019 @ 1:00 pm

Vendor Name
Address

Contact Name

Contact E Mail
Familial

Iran Econ Act
Legal Status Form

Make/Model

Unit Cost Per Chromebook
Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses
Stated Total
ALTERNATE # 1

Make/Model

Unit Cost Per Chromebook
Unit Cost Per G Suite for Education 
Device Management License

Total Cost for 700 Chromebooks 
w/Licenses
Stated Total

DHE Computers Tierney Brothers Dell Marketing LP
Centennial,CO St. Paul, MN Round Tock, TX
Merry Hammack Ben Kevern Bryan Johnston

Merry@dhecs.com
benkevern@tierney
brothers.com

Bryan_Johnston@
dell.com

YES NO YES
YES YES YES
YES YES YES

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Lenovo DWS0N75691
CTL Chromebook 
J41 Dell Chrome 5190

$211.75 $245.50 $245.00

$23.75 $25.00 $25.50

$164,850.00 $189,350.00 $189,350.00
$164,850.00 $189,350.00 $188,850.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

86



PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

4. National School Breakfast Week Proclamation 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by __________________, that the 

Board approve the National School Breakfast Week Proclamation, as presented. 
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  Enclosure VII.4. 

  February 25, 2019 

 

 

 

 

 
PROCLAMATION 

NATIONAL SCHOOL BREAKFAST WEEK 
March 4 - 8, 2019 

 
 
 
WHEREAS, It is with great respect for the accomplishments of Portage’s 

school food service managers, servers, cashiers, driver personnel and 
substitutes that we commemorate March 4 - 8, 2019 as National School 
Breakfast Week.  This special observance presents an excellent opportunity to 
emphasize research outcomes that students who eat breakfast are more alert, 
have improved memory and problem solving skills, and perform better on 
standardized tests.  We encourage all citizens to recognize the dedication and 
skill of our school food service employees; and 
 

WHEREAS, Each day, a total of 25 food service employees prepare and 
serve over 1250 breakfasts a day.  This is in addition to ordering, storing, and 
expediting each menu item to each location, adhering to food safety, sanitation, 
and nutritional guidelines as well as giving each customer the time and 
consideration to listen, hear and deliver what they are looking for each day.  
Fortunately we have exemplary professionals who have devoted their careers to 
providing high quality service to our children and staff; and  
 

WHEREAS, On behalf of our young people, it is a pleasure to commend 
the women and men who accept and meet the challenges of school food service.  
The observance of School Breakfast Week is a welcome opportunity to thank 
these patient, caring, skilled public servants.  Those involved in this pursuit 
should be very proud of their contribution to education. Now, therefore, be it 

 
RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF EDUCATION, That we proudly 

commemorate March 4 - 8, 2019 as the National School Breakfast Week, and we 
commend everyone who has contributed to the successful operation of our 
breakfast program.  By working together, we can make a difference in every 
student’s life. 

 
 
    Proclaimed this 25th day of February, 2019 
    Portage Public Schools Board Of Education 
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BOARD OF EDUCATION – REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 25, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VIII. Discussion Items 

1. Recommendation for NHS Spanish Club Trip to Peru in 2020 (OP 2340) 
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Note Page 

 

VIII. Discussion Items 

2. Recommendation for NMS Demolition Contractor (OP 6320) 
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FROM:  Ron Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations  

CC:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent 

Paula Johnson, Director of Finance  

  Tom Stanek, Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. (OAK) 

DATE:  February 21, 2019 

SUBJECT: North Middle School Demolition Recommendation (Bid Package#3) 

 

Recommendation 

 

I recommend the Board of Education authorize Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. to issue Notices of 

Pending Award, in the amounts indicated for the North Middle School demolition, to 

contractors listed on the Bid Summary Sheet. Furthermore, that upon receipt by Owen-Ames-

Kimball Co. of the appropriate documentation, a contract will be awarded to this contractor by 

Portage Public Schools, as presented. 

 

Background Information 
 

Work and budget allocation NMS demolition is a part of Bid Package #3.  At the time this bid 

package was bid out we choose to maintain a demolition allocation within the project for this 

work and to bid this out at a later date.  We believed that bidding this closer to when work was 

to be done would increase the number of bidders and create a more favorable bid result. 

This went out to bid on January 25th, 2019.  Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. (OAK) advertised on 

their SmartBid data base, the District’s Website, Builders Exchange and the State of 

Michigan’s procurement website, Sigma.  We hosted pre-bid walkthrough meetings on 

February 4th 2019.   We had approximately 9 contractors participate.  We accepted bids on 

February14, 2019.   The bids were read aloud that included the proper bid bonds and 

acknowledgement of the schedule.   

 

Since the bid openings, our team of OAK, Walbridge and PPS staff members executed the 

proper post bid interview for this project.   This process was designed to select the bidder with 

the lowest qualified bid to complete the work scope of each category, having each contractor 

validate bid pricing, ability to meet schedules with qualified resources, confirmation of work 

scope and any unique complexities of the projects.  At this time we also expressed the high 

level of expectations the Owner/ Owners Rep/ Construction Management team has for this 

project. 

 

We are confident that this process has helped us identify the lowest qualified responsible 

contractors for Board consideration and approval.  Approval of this recommendation will 

allow us to execute contract agreements and proceed with the work per the scheduled start 

times in June 2019. 

 

We will entertain any question you may have concerning this recommendation. 

Enclosure VIII.2. 
February 25, 2019 
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Alternates

Melching Y 1 $358,000

  Muskegon, MI

Pitsch Company Y 1 $465,000

  Grand Rapids, MI

Homrich Y 1 $523,000

  Caleton, MI

Dore & Associates Contracting Inc Y 1 $548,600

Bay City, MI

SC Environmental Services LLC Y 1 $588,191

  Lansing, MI

Indiana Earth Inc Y 1 $689,600

Osceola, IN

D&R Demolition Y 1 $777,750

Napoleon, MI

Universal Consolidated Demolition Y 1 $949,969

  Roseville, MI

Bierlein Companies Inc Y 1 $1,888,881

Midland, MI

NOTES

Portage Public Schools

Northern Middle School Demolition

Owen-Ames-Kimball Co., Construction Manager 

Bid Opening: Tuesday, February 14 at 3:00 PM

BID CATEGORY NO. 1 - Demolition

CONTRACTOR

B
id

 B
o

n
d

A
d

d
e
n

d
u

m

BASE BID
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VIII. Discussion Items 

3. Recommendation for Northern Natatorium (OP 6320) 
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