
GOOSE CREEK CONSOLIDATED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

SHEILA V. CANTU 
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING & WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS 

The district maintains a white fleet that requires regular maintenance, repairs, and occasional collision 
work to remain safe, reliable, and operational. Establishing an RFP for automotive repair and collision 
services, as well as parts and supplies, ensures access to qualified vendors who can provide timely, cost-
effective, and high-quality support. This helps minimize vehicle downtime, extend the lifespan of fleet 
assets, and ensure continuity of daily operations. 

A Request for Proposal (RFP) #26-009, Automotive Repair and Collision Services, Parts, Supplies and 
Related Services, was issued to over fifty (50) vendors. Fourteen (14) responses were received and 
opened by the Purchasing Department on Friday, February 6, 2026. 

• Adulfos Paint and Body Shop
• Allen and Kerber Auto Supply

(GW Parts Group, Inc)
• Baytown Collision Center, Inc.
• Carr's Tire & Automotive
• Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc
• First Collision
• Frank's Collision Repair

• Hardy Collision Center Inc.
• Joey’s Glass Inc.
• Maaco Collision Repair (KSP Holdings LLC)
• Mac Haik Ford Pasadena (Pasadena Mac Haik F

LTD)
• O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises

LLC)
• Russell and Smith Wholesale Parts
• SOS Collision Inc

An evaluation committee, comprised of representatives from various departments, was convened to 
review and assess the proposal. The committee evaluated the response based on the criteria outlined in the 
RFP. Each category was scored individually, and the totals were compiled to determine the overall 
ranking.  

Based on the evaluation results, the committee recommends awarding the proposal to all responsive 
vendors listed above.  



Supplier Scoring Summary 26-009 Addendum 1 - Automotive Repair and Collision Services, Parts, Supplies, and Related Services - Scoring Round
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0 30.00 20.00 20.00 10.00 5.00 0.00 10.00 5.00 0.00
Franks Collision Repair 1 97.00 30.00 20.00 18.67 9.67 5.00 0.00 8.67 5.00 0.00
JOEYS GLASS INC. 2 96.33 30.00 20.00 18.67 9.67 5.00 0.00 8.00 5.00 0.00
OReilly Auto Parts 3 95.33 30.00 20.00 19.67 9.67 5.00 0.00 9.33 1.67 0.00
Carrs Tire & Automotive 4 94.67 30.00 20.00 18.67 9.33 5.00 0.00 6.67 5.00 0.00
ADULFOS PAINT AND BODY 
SHOP 5 94.33 30.00 20.00 17.67 9.33 5.00 0.00 7.33 5.00 0.00

Allen and Kerber Auto Supply 6 94.00 30.00 20.00 15.33 9.33 5.00 0.00 9.33 5.00 0.00
SOS Collision Inc 7 91.67 30.00 20.00 16.33 8.67 5.00 0.00 6.67 5.00 0.00
BAYTOWN COLLISION CENTER, 
INC 8 88.00 30.00 20.00 18.00 8.33 0.00 0.00 6.67 5.00 0.00
Mac Haik Ford Pasadena 9 87.00 30.00 20.00 18.33 8.67 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 0.00
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc 10 86.67 30.00 20.00 13.00 8.67 5.00 0.00 6.67 3.33 0.00
First Collision 11 86.67 30.00 20.00 17.00 9.00 0.00 0.00 5.67 5.00 0.00
Russell and Smith Wholesale 
Pa 12 86.00 30.00 20.00 17.33 8.67 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 0.00
Maaco Collision Repair 13 82.33 30.00 20.00 14.00 8.00 0.00 0.00 5.33 5.00 0.00
Hardy Collision Center Inc. 14 81.67 30.00 20.00 13.00 8.67 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 0.00

90.12 30.00 20.00 16.83 8.98 2.86 0.00 6.81 4.64 0.00



Event Number 26-009 Addendum 1 Organization Goose Creek Consolidated 
Independent School District

Event Title Automotive Repair and 
Collision Services, Parts, 
Supplies, and Related Services

Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Heather Patt
Event Type RFP Email heather.patt@gccisd.net
Issue Date 12/19/2025 08:00:00 AM (CT) Phone 1 (281) 707-3869
Close Date 2/6/2026 02:00:00 PM (CT) Fax 1 (281) 421-3392

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
ADULFOS PAINT AND BODY 
SHOP (ADULFO AMADOR)

BAYTOWN TX 1/23/2026 10:56:39 AM (CT) 3 0%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Allen and Kerber Auto Supply 
(GW Parts Group, Inc)

La Porte TX 1/16/2026 10:44:41 AM (CT) 2 47-58%
(Matrials & Supplies, Parts)

BAYTOWN COLLISION CENTER, 
INC

Baytown TX 1/29/2026 02:10:02 PM (CT) 3 5%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Carr's Tire & Automotive Baytown TX 1/13/2026 09:32:51 AM (CT) 3 0% 
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc HOUSTON TX 2/5/2026 11:01:50 AM (CT) 1 0%
(Materials & Supplies)

First Collision Baytown TX 1/30/2026 08:29:23 AM (CT) 3 5-10% 
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Frank's Collision Repair Baytown TX 1/29/2026 07:09:14 PM (CT) 3 10%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Hardy Collision Center Inc. Houston/TX TX 1/22/2026 05:56:57 PM (CT) 3 10-20%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

JOEYS GLASS INC. BAYTOWN TX 1/29/2026 04:47:41 PM (CT) 3 1%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Maaco Collision Repair (KSP 
Holdings LLC)

Baytown TX 2/2/2026 02:33:25 PM (CT) 3 15%
(Labor Rates, Materials & Supplies, Parts)
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Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
Mac Haik Ford Pasadena 
(Pasadena Mac Haik F LTD)

Pasadena TX 1/29/2026 02:55:02 PM (CT) 1 34%
(Parts)

O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly 
Auto Enterprises LLC)

Springfield MO 1/8/2026 02:52:58 PM (CT) 2 41%
(Materials & Supplies, Parts)

Russell and Smith Wholesale 
Parts

Houston TX 1/30/2026 12:55:38 PM (CT) 3 15-30%
(Labor Rates, Material & Supplies, Parts)

SOS Collision Inc Houston TX 1/15/2026 07:16:20 PM (CT) 3 0%
(Labor Rates, Material & Supplies, Parts)

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1

2
Supplier Percentage Extended Supplier Notes
ADULFOS PAINT AND BODY SHOP (ADULFO AMADOR) 0.0%
BAYTOWN COLLISION CENTER, INC 5.0%
Carr's Tire & Automotive 0.0%
First Collision 10.0%
Frank's Collision Repair 10.0%
Hardy Collision Center Inc. 20.0%
JOEYS GLASS INC. 1.0%
Maaco Collision Repair (KSP Holdings LLC) 15.0%
Russell and Smith Wholesale Parts 15.0%
SOS Collision Inc 0.0%
Allen and Kerber Auto Supply (GW Parts Group, Inc) No Bid
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc No Bid
Mac Haik Ford Pasadena (Pasadena Mac Haik F LTD) No Bid
O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC) No Bid

3
Supplier Percentage Extended Supplier Notes
ADULFOS PAINT AND BODY SHOP (ADULFO AMADOR) 0.0%
Allen and Kerber Auto Supply (GW Parts Group, Inc) 0.0%
BAYTOWN COLLISION CENTER, INC 5.0%
Carr's Tire & Automotive 0.0%
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc 0.0%
First Collision 10.0%
Frank's Collision Repair 10.0%
Hardy Collision Center Inc. 10.0%
JOEYS GLASS INC. 1.0%
Maaco Collision Repair (KSP Holdings LLC) 15.0%
O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC) 41.0%
Russell and Smith Wholesale Parts 15.0%
SOS Collision Inc 0.0%
Mac Haik Ford Pasadena (Pasadena Mac Haik F LTD) No Bid

4
Supplier Percentage Extended Supplier Notes
SOS Collision Inc 0.0%
ADULFOS PAINT AND BODY SHOP (ADULFO AMADOR) 0.0%
Allen and Kerber Auto Supply (GW Parts Group, Inc) 0.0%
BAYTOWN COLLISION CENTER, INC 0.0%
Carr's Tire & Automotive 0.0%
First Collision 1.0%
Frank's Collision Repair 5.0%

Discount/Pricing Structure Information:

Discount Percentage Off Labor Rates

Discount Percentage Off Materials & Supplies

Discount Percentage Off Parts
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Hardy Collision Center Inc. 10.0%
JOEYS GLASS INC. 10.0%
Maaco Collision Repair (KSP Holdings LLC) 15.0%
Mac Haik Ford Pasadena (Pasadena Mac Haik F LTD) 30.0%
O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises LLC) 34.0%
Russell and Smith Wholesale Parts 41.0%
Delegard Tool of Texas, Inc No Bid
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